
Appendix A. Explanatory Materials 

DEFINITIONS AND EXPLANATIONS 

1. HISTORY OF THE CENSUS OF AGRICULTURE 

The 1969 census is the 19th nationwide census of agriculture. 
The first agricultural census was taken in 1840 as part of the 
Sixth Decennial Census. From 1840 to 1920, an agricultural 
census was taken every 10 years as part of each decennial census. 

With increased application of scientific findings and growing use 
of mechanization in agriculture, farming practices were changing 
so rapidly that early in this century it was evident that facts 
collected at 10-year intervals were no longer adequate. Aware of 
the need for more accurate and timely information, the Congress, 
in 1909 (36 Stat. 10, Sec. 31). provided for a census of 
agriculture to be taken in 1915 and every 10 years thereafter, in 
addition to the census of agriculture taken at the time of the 
decennial census. However, the census was not taken in 1915 
because of the abnormal conditions created by World War I. 
Beginning in 1920, a national agricultural census has been taken 
every five years. 

·2. HOW THE 1969 CENSUS OF AGRICULTURE 
WAS TAKEN 

Enumeration Method 

For the first time in a nationwide census of agriculture, farmers 
were asked to fill out and mail back their census forms. In earlier 
censuses, enumerators called on all farm operators. Beginning 
with the 1950 census, copies of the report form were mailed 
prior to the enumeration starting date and farmers were asked to 
fill them out and have them ready for the enumerator to pick up. 
The enumerators going from door to door in rural areas would 
pick up and review any forms that had been completed; they 
would also fill out or complete forms for those places classified 
as farms which did not have forms ready for review. 

Use of the mailout/mailback approach had been considered 
earlier and some aspects had been included in pretests for the 
1964 Census of Agriculture as well as in the evaluation surveys 
measuring the accuracy of the earlier censuses. A coverage check 
of the 1964 census was especially pertinent in the final decision 
to adopt the mailout/mailback method for the 1969 census. A 
brief description of the study, called the "EPA-IRS Match" 
appears on page 38 of volume Ill, part 7, Evaluation Surveys, of 
the 1964 Census of Agriculture. 

The Mailing List 

The starting point for the enumeration of the 1969 Census of 
Agriculture was a mailing list comprised of all persons and 
organizations that could be readily identified as associated with 
the direction of agricultural operations in 1969. Only the more 
comprehensive sets of administrative records containing infor­
mation related to agricultural activities were used initially. 

The list was assembled primarily from the records of other 
Government agencies and from the 1964 Census of Agriculture 
lists of addresses. Internal Revenue Service records were particu-

larly significant in developing the mailing list, since most farm 
operators of any importance could be identified in these records. 
Specifically, the IRS supplied lists of people and organizations 
who filed Form 1040, Schedule F (farm operators and farm 
landlords). The IRS also supplied lists of businesses showing, on 
Form 1040-Schedule C, Form 1065 (partnerships). and Form 
11205 (small business corporations). that more than 50 percent 
of their income was from agriculture. A listing of employers of 
agricultural workers filing agriculture employment tax reports on 
Social Security Administration Form 943 was also used. The 
Bureau supplemented these lists with the names of Agriculture 
Stabilization and Conservation Service participants in the south 
and selected States in the remainder of the country where there 
appeared to be a significant number of persons with limited 
agricultural operations who had not filed IRS Schedule F. 

The Bureau amended the basic list by conducting a precanvass 
early in 1969, covering about 100,000 of the larger more 
complex farms. The precanvass identified separate farm units of 
multifarm operations, farms with significant acreages in more 
than one county, and abnormal operations such as Indian 
reservations and farms operated by institutions. 

The master list, constructed by merging and unduplicating the 
various source lists on the basis of Social Security or Employer 
Identification numbers, contained the names and addresses of 
persons or organizations associated with agricultural operations, 
and an indication of the size of the operation so that the Bureau 
could determine which of two versions of the census form to 
send. 

Lists of specialized operations, such as nurseries and broiler 
operations, which might not be identified in the administrative 
records as associated with agricultural operations were obtained 
and a supplemental mailing was made to the names and addresses 
on these lists. 

Duplicate names not identified prior to mailing were removed 
during office processing. 

The Census Forms and Their Distribution 

The regular 12-page form (A 1) was sent to farms with an 
expected volume of sales of agricultural products in 1969, of 
$2,500 or more. 

A four-page form (A2) was sent to a 50-percent sample of 
operators whose 1969 sales were expected to total less than 
$2,500. This form covered all major items-land use, crops, 
livestock and poultry, equipment, expenditures, and income-but 
omitted much of the detail found in the regular form. 

Both forms are reproduced in appendix B. 

Why the two forms? Emphasis in this census was placed on 
obtaining more detailed information for those farms with annual 
sales of farm products of $2,500 or more. In 1964 the 
1,817,000 farms in this group, which made up 58 percent ~f the 
total farms, accounted for more than 96 percent of the total 
value of all farm products sold. 
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It was agreed that the operators of the smaller places need not be 
burdened with the extensive detail required from the operators 
who are responsible for virtually all of our commercial farm 
production. Hence, the short form was developed for the 
operators whose 1969 sales were expected to be less than $2,500. 

The Initial Mailings 

During the last week of December 1969, the report forms were 
mailed to all farm operators on the mailing list. Approximately 
3,700,000 forms were mailed at this time-2,900,000 regular 
forms (A 1) and 800,000 short forms (A2). 

The A2 form was not used in Alaska and Hawaii; A 1's were 
mailed to all names on the address list. The A 1 form used in 
Alaska was the same as the one used in the other continental 
States. The A 1 form used in Hawaii differed primarily in the 
crops section, since Hawaiian agriculture has significant differ­
ences from the mainland in the crops produced. 

During the first part of 1970, lists of persons or firms filing 1969 
tax returns showing agricultural operations were obtained from 
the Internal Revenue Service. The Bureau checked these names 
against the original mailing list to find individuals and organiza­
tions who had not reported agricultural operations in their 1968 
income tax reports or who, for some other reason, had not been 
included in the December 1969 mailing. These operators were 
sent the appropriate regular or short form in a supplementary 
mailing in July 1970. 

All potential farm operators who were sent the regular form, 
received with it a Leaflet Guide which carried on the cover a 
letter from the Chief of the Agriculture Division explaining the 
purpose of the census and asking the recipient to fill out the 
form and return it in the envelope enclosed. The leaflet provided 
descriptions and definitions for the various items in more detail 
than was shown on the form, as well as instructions regarding 
some of the more common problem situations that were 
anticipated and lists of what should be included or excluded in 
reporting the more complex items. 

A reproduction of this Leaflet Guide appears in appendix B. 

Potential operators who received the short form were sent the 
cover letter, but not the leaflet. Instructions for this relatively 
simple form were provided on the form itself. 

It was intended that the regular form would be filled out by the 
operators of all farms with $2,500 or more in sales of far~ 
products. When recipients of the short form reported sales m 
1969 substantially above this breaking point, it was necessary to 
go back to them for the additional detail needed for the regular 
form. If the recipient of the regular form reported less than 
$2,500 in sales, data were tabulated for only those items which 
were on the short form. 

Coverage of Outlying Areas 

The mailout/mailback procedure was not used in taking the 
agriculture census in Puerto Rico, Guam, the Vir~i~ Islands, 
American Samoa, and the Trust Territory of the Pac1f1c Islands. 
Discussion of the methods used appears in the reports for the 
outlying areas. 

Followup Procedures 

In the United States, a reminder card dated January 10, 1970, 
was sent to all recipients of the reQtilar form, urging prompt 
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response and expressing thanks "if your response is already in the 
mail." 

The first followup letter was mailed early in March to all those 
on the original mailing list from whom we had not received either 
the completed form or other correspondence by February 25th. 

After the first mail followup, telephone and field followup was 
started early in March to be sure that data were collected from the 
previously identified very large and/or very complex operations. 

Over a period of the next three months, three other followup 
letters were sent to the other nonrespondents to achieve a 
response over the 90-percent level by July 1, 1970. 

After the mailing of the fourth followup letter, data collection 
efforts continued, but on a selective basis. Field enumeration by 
personal interview was used to collect the data from non­
respondents in 371 counties where response rates were below 
acceptable limits. 

The collection of missing reports continued, as necessary, into 
the office processing phase. Lists of farms with substantial pro­
duction of specific farm products had been obtained from various 
sources. These lists were used during data review as a check in 
counties having significant differences between the expected and 
the tabulated amounts of one or more agricultural products. 
Farms appearing on the lists for which a report was not found in 
the file of census reports being processed were contacted, usually 
by telephone. If it was determined that a farm had indeed been 
missed, a report was obtained. 

The processing system provided for the possibility of incorpo­
rating reports as late as the final tabulation of county data for 
each State. 

The telephone and field followup was performed either by the 
permanent staff of the Bureau's regional field offices assisted by 
staff held over from the population census enumeration or, in the 
case of the very large and complex agricultural operations, by 
Agriculture Division staff members. 

3. STATISTICAL ADJUSTMENT PROCEDURES 

Report forms were completed and tabulated for all the indenti­
fiable larger places. In a few instances where the required 
information could not be obtained from the operator, data were 
obtained from secondary sources. 

The smaller operations for which data were not obtained are 
represented in the statistics by replication of reports for farms 
having similar characteristics in the same county. 

The majority of the farms represented by replication are among 
those having a total value of agricultural products sold in 1969 of 
less than $10,000. For Wyoming, data were imputed for about 
8 percent of the State's farms, accounting for about 3 percent 
of the State's total value of agricultural products sold. 

All report forms were subjected to a computer edit where 
adjustments using detailed programed specifications were made 
for incomplete or internally inconsistent data. The procedures 
provided for printouts of the computer changes for those farm 
reports if the change exceeded specified limits for the item. 
These changes were then reviewed for reasonableness by Agri­
culture Division staff members. 



4. OFFICE PROCESSING 

The reports for all farms were reviewed prior to keying the data 
to magnetic tape. Records for large agricultural operations, 
including all places of 50,000 acres or more, or having $100,000 
sales of agricultural products or more in 1969, were reviewed by 
a professional employee (agricultural statistician or economist). 
Omissions, inconsistencies, and other problems that could not be 
resolved by reference to other information on the report were 
resolved by contact (usually telephone) with the respondent. 
Reports for smaller operations were subjected to a clerical editing 
review, during which significant problems were referred to the 
professional analysts for solution. 

During processing, the data for each report form were subjected 
to a detailed review which required almost the full capacity of 
one of the very large electronic computers. The program provided 
comprehensive tests and instructions which were used to correct 
data found to be in error or inconsistent, to supply missing data, 
and to make classifications of the farm necessary for tabulation 
of data. 

5. COMPLETENESS OF THE CENSUS 

Although a complt!te and fully accurate count of farms, farm 
land, and farm production is the aim of each general, nationwide 
census of agriculture, it has never been reached. The causes of 
incompleteness and inaccuracies are a part of the complex 
structure of America's agriculture. Among the elements involved 
are the large number of places to be enumerated, the variety of 
arrangements under which farms are operated, the continuing 
changes in the relationship of farm operators to the land they 
operate, the expiration of leases and the making or renewal of 
other leases, the problems of obtaining a complete unduplicated 
listing of all agricultural operators, the difficulties of locating and 
identifying places that might be farms, the absence from their 
farms of some farmers during the period of the mail effort and 
followup procedures, the opinions of some operators that some 
or all of their agricultural operations should not be included in 
the census, etc. 

Preliminary results of a check of coverage in the State indicate 
that about 91 percent of the farms with a total value of 
agricultural products sold in 1969 of $2,500 and over, are 
included in the census. The 1969 coverage of part-time, 
part-retirement, and other low-income operations is probably less 
complete than for 1964 and earlier censuses. These types of 
operations are most likely to have been missing in the administra­
tive records used in assembling the basic mailing list. The farms 
included are estimated to account for more than 95 percent of 
the total value of agricultural production for the State. 

A more detailed statement regarding the differences in coverage 
between the 1969 and 1964 censuses of agriculture is provided in 
the Introduction to volume II of the reports for the 1969 and 
1964 censuses. In addition, a detailed report on coverage of the 
1969 census is scheduled to be published separately. 

6. COMPARABILITY OF DATA 

A factor affecting comparability, in addition to those mentioned 
in the introduction, was the procedure for assigning a farm to a 
specific geographic area. 

For 1964 and earlier censuses, each enumerator was assigned to 
enumerate all farms in a specific geographic area, and farms were 
allocated to the area in which their "headquarters" was located. · 

Each of the 1969 farms was assigned to a "most probable" 
county and that county name was listed on the mailing label 
before the form was sent to the address on the mailing list. The 
assignment was based upon factors such as records of the 
Agricultural Stabilization and Conservation Service, the location 
of the post office, and county of location of the majority of rural 
route patrons. The respondent was asked to check if all his 
agricultural operations were located in the county shown on the 
address label, otherwise to identify the "principal" county in 
which his agricultural operations were conducted, and to name 
all other counties in which he had agricultural operations. If he 
failed to do this correctly, and especially if the preassigned "most 
probable" county was incorrect, the acres in the farm may have 
been tabulated for a different county than in 1964 and earlier 
censuses. In addition, even when the respondent replied 
correctly, if two counties or more were involved, his concept of 
the principal county where his. agricultural operations were 
located might well have differed from the location of his 
"headquarters" as determined by the enumerator in the earlier 
census. 

7. THE "SEE TEXT" REFERENCES AND OTHER NOTES 
FOR THE TABLES 

Those items in the State tables which carry the note "see text" 
are identified in this section by being enclosed in quotation 
marks. Explanations and notes are shown for additional items. 

Table 1 

Total cropland may be overstated for 1969 as compared to 
earlier censuses due largely to the respondent (in most cases the 
farm operator) reporting his land in a different classification than 
that reported by the enumerators in earlier censuses. 

Cropland used only for pasture and grazing may be overstated for 
1969, due in part to a tendency of operators to report all pasture 
in replying to the first question regarding pasture (item 1 b in 
section 3 of the regular form, and item 2 in section 5 of the short 
form). 

"All other cropland" includes cropland used for soil­
improvement crops, crop failure, cultivated summer fallow, and 
idle cropland. 

"All other land" includes pastureland other than cropland and 
woodland pasture, rangeland, and land in house lots, barn lots, 
ponds, roads, wasteland, etc. 

Table 2 

Irrigation. Data on method of irrigation and source of water, along 
with additional irrigation data will be available in chapter 14, 
volume II, U.S. Summary, and in volume IV, Irrigation, 1969 
Census of Agriculture. 

Table 3 

The 1964 and 1959 data reported in the columns headed "Negro 
operated farms" include the farms of all nonwhite operators. 

Users may notice that data for managers are not shown 
separately in the repo;t of farm operators by tenure. Discussion 
of this change from the 1964 and earlier reports will be found in 
section 8, immediately following ~his section. 

Tenure data for 1964 and 1959 do not include farms operated by 
managers, and to this extent are not comparable to the 1969 
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figures in which the managers have been distributed according to 
the reported ownership of the land. 

Additional information regarding farm operators will be reported 
in volume II. This volume will include data reporting year the 
operator began operation, detailed data regarding race, and 
average date the census form was completed. 

Data on ownership of land rented from others, type of rental 
arrangements, and farms with grazing permits will be reported in 
volume II, with totals for each State. 

Table4 

"Class 6 farms" have a value of farm products sold of $50 to 
$2,499 and a farm operator under 65 years of age who did not 
work off the farm 100 days or more in the census year. 

"Part-time farms" have a value of farm products sold of $50 to 
$2,499 and a farm operator under 65 years of age who worked 
off the farm 100 days or more in the census year. 

"Part-retirement farms" have a value of farm products sold of 
$50 to $2,499 and an operator 65 years old or over. 

"Abnormal farms" include institutional farms, experimental and 
research farms, and Indian reservations. Institutional farms 
include those operated by hospitals, penitentiaries, schools, 
grazing associations, government agencies, etc. 

"Market value of all agricultural products sold" represents the 
market value, before taxes and expenses, of all agricultural 
products sold in the census year, including livestock and poultry 
and their products, crops including nursery products and hay, 
forest products, and all miscellaneous farm products. The figures 
include landlords' and contractors' shares. 

Table 5 

Farm production expenses, total-both farms and dollars. These 
figures for 1969 are heavily weighted by the effect of the 
reporting of "all other expenditures." The 1964 and 1959 totals 
are reported only for the items specifically covered in all three 
censuses. 

Commercially mixed formula feeds. Feed ingredients purchased 
separately which were included for 1964 and 1959 are excluded 
for 1969; they are reported separately for 1969 (table 14) for 
farms with sales of $2,500 and over. 

Commercial fertilizer. Data for 1969 include the cost of rock 
phosphate and gypsum; these items were not included in the 
1964 or 1959 figures. 

"Other agricultural chemicals" includes all herbicides, fungicides, 
other pesticides, growth control chemicals, and defoliants used 
for crops, and insecticides for livestock and poultry in the census 
year. 

All other production expenses. This item is subject to some 
errors in reporting. Operators failed, in some cases, to follow the 
instructions as to the types of expenditures which were to be 
included or e~cluded. Obvious errors were corrected during the 
processing, but the dollar figures for this item should be used 
with caution. 
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Table 7 

The 1964 and 1959 figures on broilers and other meat-type 
chickens are based on questions which had no specification 
regarding age. 

Table 8 

Farms reporting acres and quantity harvested for soybeans for 
beans are underreported. The format of the regular report form 
(the A 1) provided for related crops to be grouped in one of 12 
sections each of which had an introductory general question and 
instructions for the respondent to skip the entire section 
whenever he answered "No." The introductory question to 
section 11, where soybeans for beans should have been reported, 
was "Were any dry beans, dry peas, or peanuts harvested from 
this place in 1969?" A limited number of respondents who had 
harvested soybeans apparently did not classify soybeans as dry 
beans and skipped the entire section. Some of these reported the 
crop in section 23, "Other crops," while others failed to report 
them. In instances where there was a sizeable difference on an 
individual report form between the acres of cropland harvested 
and the sum of the acr~s reported for individual crops harvested, 
telephone calls made to check on the difference determined that 
it was frequently due to failure to report either soybean or hay 
acreages. The missing data were then obtained and the reports 
corrected. Consequently such underreporting tends to be limited 
to smaller acreages. Studies of available check data indicate the 
shortages to be about 5 percent or less for farms reporting and 
somewhat lower for acres and quantity harvested. 

Hay, excluding sorghum hay. There was also underreporting for 
hay since the introductory general question for section 14 on the 
regular form which reads "Was any hay or grass silage harvested 
from this place in 1969?" was misunderstood in some instances. 
Additionally, it has always been difficult to obtain correct 
reporting of acreage cut for hay involving, as it frequently does, 
two or more cuttings from the same acreage, hay cut and seed 
harvested from the same acreage, or a hay crop following some 
other crop harvested. 

"Land in orchards" includes land in bearing and nonbearing fruit 
orchards, citrus or other groves, vineyards, and nut trees of all 
ages, including land on which the fruit crop failed. It does not 
include acres in abandoned plantings or data for places with less 
than 20 fruit or nut trees. 

Table 9 

"All other cropland." See note for table 1. 

"All other land." See note for table 1. 

"Farms by type." Explanation of this classification is shown in 
section 8. 

Livestock ranches. See classification of farms in section 8. 

"Market value of all agricultural products sold." See note for 
table 4. 

Forest products sold. As in previous censuses, the data obtained 
in the 1969 census relate only to the forest products cut on 
farms. Commercial logging, timber operations, and forest 
products cut and sold from nonfarm places are excluded. 

"Other agricultural chemicals." See note for table 5. 

"Land in orchards." See note for table 8. 



Table 10 

"All other land." See note for table 1. 

Table 13 

"Market value of all agricultural products sold." See note for 
table 4. 

"$1 to $2,499." In the processing, certain farms were identified 
whose operations would normally have a sale of farm products of 
$2,500 or more, but had actual sales of less than $2,500 in 1969. 
These farms are grouped with class 1-5 farms for the more 
detailed tabulations reported in tables 9 through 30, and are 
included in class 5 whenever figures are shown separately by 
class. They are included in the appropriate value groups having 
sales of less than $2,500, in table 4. 

Table 14 

"Other agricultural chemicals." See note for table 5. 

Hired farm labor and Contract labor. Some operators may not 
have clearly distinguished these two types of farm labor. Some 
reported expenditures for contract labor although the workers 
were not hired through a contractor, a crewleader, a cooperative, 
etc. 

Number working less than 150 days. Some of these workers may 
have worked on more than one farm during the year, and 
therefore be reported by two or more operators. The number of 
workers reported here is likely to exceed the actual number of 
agricultural workers. 

Table 16 

"Chickens 4 months old or older" for 1964 and 1959. Note the 
age break at 4 months for these earlier censuses. This was 
changed to "3 months old or older" for the 1969 census. 

Table 21 

Grass silage. 1964 and 1959 figures include grass sil3ge and hay 
cut green. 

Soybeans for beans. See note for table 8. 

All hay. See note for table 8. 

"Land in orchards." See note for table 8. 

Table22 

Forest products. See note for table 9. 

Table 24 

"All other land." See note for table 1. 

Artificial drainage. Only total drained acres and number of farms 
having such acres are reported here. More detailed data will be 
available in volume II, chapter 14, Irrigation and Drainage, and in 
volume VI, Drainage. 

Farms by type. Definitions for the various types of farms are 
given in section 8. 

"$1 to $2,499." See note for table 13. 

Forest products sold. See note for table 9. 

Farm production expenses, total. See note for table 5. 

Commercially mixed formula feeds. See note for table 5. 

"Other agricultural chemicals." See note for table 5. 

Hired farm labor and Contract labor. See note for table 14. 

Number of persons working less than 150 days. See note for 
table 14. 

All other production expenses. See note for table 5. 

Soybeans for beans. See note for table 8. 

"Land in orchards." See note for table 8. 

Tables 25 to 30 

See notes for table 24. The items in the left-hand margin (stub) 
of these tables are identical to the items in table 24, therefore the 
notes for this table apply to tables 25 through 30. 

8. DEFINITIONS, EXPLANATIONS, AND CLASSIFICATION 
OF FARMS 

Definitions and Explanations 

For exact wording of the questions and instructions in the two 
census forms (A 1 and A2) and in the Leaflet Guide which 
accompanied the A 1 form, see the reproductions of these three 
items in appendix B. 

An analysis of the questions asked in the 1969 census forms and 
of the data obtained will be given in volume II, General Report, 
Statistics by Subject, Census of Agriculture, 1969. 

Definitions of items and terms which may require additional 
explanation as they are used in the census are presented here. In 
general, processing steps and procedures were designed to 
develop a report as fully comparable as possible with reports of 
earlier censuses. The more important exceptions are noted here. 

Land in farms-The acreage designated in the tables as "Land in 
farms" consists primarily of "agricultural" land-that is, land 
used for crops or pasture or grazing. It also includes considerable 
areas of land not actually under cultivation nor used for pasture 
or grazing. For example, the acreage of woodland and wasteland 
owned or rented by farm operators as part of their agricultural 
operations is included as land in farms. Large acreages of land 
held for nonagricultural purposes were deleted in the processing 
steps if identified as such. 

All grazing land except for open range and grazing land used 
under government permit was to be included as land in farms 
provided the place of which it was a part was a farm. Grazing 
land operated by grazing associations was to be reported in the 
name of the person chiefly responsible for conducting the 
business of the association. Land used rent free was to be 
reported as land rented from others. All land in Indian 
reservations used for growing crops or grazing livestock was to be 
included. Land in Indian reservations that was not reported by 
individual Indians and that was not rented to non-Indians was to 
be reported in the name of the cooperative group that used the 
land. In some instances, an entire Indian reservation was reported 
as one farm. 
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Land area-The approximate total land area of States and 
counties as reported for 1969 represents the land area as 
determined by records and calculations updated to January 1, 
1970. Differences between the land area in the 1969 and 1964 
reports reflect changes in the number or size of reservoirs, lakes, 
streams, etc. 

Land in two or more counties-With but few exceptions, each 
farm was tabulated as being in the operator's principal county, 
usually the county in which he reported all or the largest 
proportion of his total land. 

Some of the exceptions developed from a survey of large-scale 
farms carried out prior to the mailing of the census forms. This 
study identified about 1,000 operations having more than one 
separately reportable farm unit. For these, individual census 
reports were obtained for each location. Reports received 
showing land in noncontiguous counties, for which the data 
would significantly affect the county totals, were separated into 
two or more reports which were assigned to the appropriate 
counties during office processing. 

Value of land and buildings-Data on the value of land and 
buildings are presented as totals and in terms of average per farm 
and average per acre. The value of land and buildings reported for 
the census was supposed to represent market value-that is, the 
price for which the land and buildings would sell at the time of 
the census. 

The value of land in buildings for farms for which the value was 
not completely reported was estimated during office processing 
by using the average value per acre of land and buildings for 
farms of approximately the same size having similar character­
istics in the same area. 

Type of organization-The 1969 census is the first in which 
information was collected on the type of organization under 
which the farm operated. This information was collected for class 
1-5 farms in response to the demand for data more descriptive of 
current farm organizational structure than the traditional tenure 
of farm operator classification. See State table 24. 

Farm managers-In 1969, the term "manager" was dropped as a 
tenure concept because it was no longer descriptive of a distinct 
type of farm management. Farms of the kind that would have 
qualified as managed according to the 1964 definition were 
distributed among full owners, part owners, and tenants 
according to the reported ownership of the land in the place. 
Tables in this report showing 1964 tenure data do not include 
managed farms in the 1964 figures used, and to this extent the 
1964 data are not comparable to the 1969 data. 

Farm operator-The term "farm operator" is used to designate a 
person who operates a farm, either doing the work himself or 
directly supervising the work. He may be the owner, a member of 
the owner's household, a salaried manager, or a tenant, renter, or 
sharecropper. If he rents land to others or has land worked on 
shares by others, he is considered as operator only of the land 
which he retains for his own operation. In the case of a 
partnership, only one partner is counted as an operator. For 
census purposes the number of farm operators is the same as the 
number of farms. 

For 1969, the respondent classified his own status by his answers 
to the acreage and ownership questions. Data on the character­
istics of farni operators were obtained in section 38 of the report 
form where the operator was defined as the person in charge of 
the farm or ranch operation. In some cases the operator was not 
the individual named on the address label. Sometimes informa-
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tion was reported for a family member, a partner, or an operator 
more closely connected with the farm or ranch operations. 

In the 1964 census, the farm operator was located and defined 
by the enumerator who generally obtained the report from the 
person in charge at the farm or ranch location. 

Farms or farms reporting-Figures for farms or farms reporting 
for a specified item represent the number of farms for which the 
item was reported. For example, if there were 1,922 farms in a 
county and 465 had chickens 3 months old and over on hand 
December 31, 1969, the figure for farms or farms reporting for 
the item "Chickens 3 months old and over" would be 465. 

Value of crops harvested-Data for value of crops harvested were 
developed by applying estimated unit values to the operators' 
reports of acres or quantity harvested. Generally, harvested units 
of production (bushels, bales, etc.) when reported, were multi­
plied by State estimates of price per unit. In some instances only 
acres harvested were reported, and these were multiplied by State 
estimates of value of production per acre. A combination of the 
two calculations was used when only acres harvested were, 
reported by small farms, but units of production were supplied 
by larger farms. The State average production price and 
production value per acre figures used in these calculations, were 
supplied by the Statistical Reporting Service of the U.S. 
Department of Agriculture. 

For vegetables and for nursery and greenhouse products, value of 
sales were obtained from farm operators and used in the 
calculation of total value of crops harvested. 

Value of livestock on farms-Data for value of livestock on farms 
were obtained by multiplying the number of each class of 
livestock or poultry on hand by the State average price for 1969 
as furnished by the U.S. Department of Agriculture. The 1964 
and 1959 data were developed in similar fashion. 

Value of farm products sold-Data for the value of farm products 
sold in 1969 were obtained by direct questioning in both the 
regular and short forms. 

This is a departure from the method used in previous censuses, in 
which data on value of sales were obtained by enumeration for 
some products and by estimation for others. A discussion of the 
methods used in the 1964 census will be found on pages A7 to 
A9 of the appendix in each State report (volume I) of the 1964 
census. 

Total value of farm products sold-For 1969, this item excludes 
income which the farm operator and members of his family 
received from providing hunting, fishing, picnicking, camping, 
boarding and lodging, or other recreational services on his farm; 
for 1964, the total included such income. 

The total value of farm products sold does not include 
government payments received by farm operators for participa­
tion in wheat, feed grains, and other government programs. As 
indicated by the data in State table 4, farm operators receive 
considerable farm-related income from sources other than the 
farm operated. Data in State table 27 indicate, for the various 
economic classes of farms, the number of farms on which the 
farm operator received income from specified sources other than 
the farm operated, and the amount of such income. 

Total income the farm operator and members of his family 
received from sources other than the farm operated is not 
available from the 1969 Census of Agriculture. Tabulations are 
being made from the 1970 Census of Population to provide such 



information which may be useful in this regard in a separate 
report. 

Differences in totals for some items-The totals given in one table 
for an item may differ slightly from the total given for the same 
item in another table because of the rounding of fractions for the 
several groups of farms, counties, etc. 

Floating point system-In preparation for showing comparative 
figures from the 1964 Census of Agriculture, the 1964 published 
figures were keyed to magnetic tape using a floating point 
system. The system used provides for showing the first five digits 
of a number, the sixth is rounded to a five and all subsequent 
digits are shown as zero. Thus, the figure 17,256,423 would 
appear as 17,256,500. Differences from the 1964 published 
figures may appear in the least significant digits for any number 
having six or more digits as a result of using this procedure. 

Classification of Farms 

State table 9 presents detailed data for all farms classified by 
selected economic class groups; State tables 24 to 29 present 
detailed data for class 1-5 farms classified by tenure of operator, 
type of organization, age of operator, size (in acres). economic 
class, and type. In addition, the report contains a number of 
counts of farms according to various characteristics as well as 
frequency distribution of farms classified by size of each of the 
principal farm enterprises. 

Farms by tenure of operator-As mentioned earlier in this 
section, the term "manager" as a tenure concept, is not used in 
the 1969 census. Information regarding managers was not 
obtained separately as the concept has become increasingly 
difficult to define and identify, especially with the change to 
enumeration by mail. The classifications by type of organization 
should provide more meaningful information. Detailed data by 
tenure of operator and type of organization are shown in State 
table 24. 

The classifications of tenure as used in this census are-
a. Full owners, who operate only land they own; 
b. Part owners, who operate land they own and also land they 

rent from others; and 
c. Tenants, who operate only land they rent from others, or 

work on shares for others. 

Farms by type of organization-This is the first census of 
agriculture in which the classification by type of organization has 
been used. The classifications used are-

a. Individual or family farms, excluding partnership and 
corporation, 

b. Partnership, 
c. Corporation, including family owned­

With 10 or fewer shareholders, 
With more than 10 shareholders, 

d. Other-includes estates, trusts, cooperatives. 

The farms were classified according to the information provided 
, in section 37 on the A 1 form. Thus there may be data shown for 
corporate farms in States where there are regulations affecting 
the extent to which corporations are permitted to engage in 
farming operations. 

Many of the reports which showed "other" as the type of 
organization are institutional farms, Indian reservations, or other 
operations classified as "abnormal" and consequently are not 
included in the tabulations for class 1-5 farms. 

Farms by size-All farms were classified by size according to the 
total land area established for each farm. Detailed data by size of 
farm are presented for class 1-5 farms in State table 26. The same 
classification was used for all States. According to definition, a 
farm is essentially an operating unit, not an ownership tract. All 
land operated by one person or partnership represents one farm. 
In the case of a landlord who has assigned land to other tenants, 
the land assigned to each tenant is considered a separate farm 
even though the landlord may consider the entire landholding as 
one unit in respect to supervision, equipment, rotation practice, 
purchase of supplies, or sale of products. 

Farms by economic class-Data from the 1969 census are 
reported for "All farms" and for "Farms with sales of $2,500 
and over (economic classes 1 to 5)." 

In the 1964 and earlier censuses a classification called "com­
mercial farms" was used which included the first six economic 
classes; this grouping is not comparable to the "class 1-5" 
grouping used in the 1969 report. 

To help bridge this gap, State table 9 shows data for the "class 
1-6" group, in addition to data for all farms, class 6 farms, part 
time, part retirement, and abnormal farms. 

The economic classes used in this report are defined as follows: 

Class 1 ........ $40,000 or more of farm product sales 

Class 1a ....... $100,000 or more of farm product sales 

Class 1b ....... $40,000 to $99,999 of farm product sales 

Class 2 ........ $20,000 to $39,999 of farm product sales 

Class 3 ........ $10,000 to $19,999 of farm product sales 

Class 4 ........ $5,000 to $9,999 of farm product sales 

Class 5 ........ $2,500 to $4,999 of farm product sales or 
having a value of products sold of less than 
$2,500 provided they had the acreage or 
livestock operations which normally would 
have had sales in excess of $2,500. These 
would include new farm operations, farms 
having crop failure, and farms with large 
inventories and small 1969 sales. For a count 
of these farms, see county table 13 or State 
table 22. 

Class 6 ........ $50 to $2,499 of farm product sales and a 
farm operator who is under 65 years of age 
and did not work off the farm 100 days or 
more in the census year. 

Part time ...... $50 to $2,499 of farm product sales and a 
farm operator who is under 65 years of age 
and worked off the farm 100 days or more 
in the census year. 

Part retirement .. $50 to $2,499 of farm product sales and a 
farm operator who is 65 years old or over. 

Abnormal ..... Includes institutional farms, experimental 
and research farms, and Indian reservations. 
Institutional farms include those operated 
by hospitals, penitentiaries, schools, grazing 
associations, government agencies, etc. 
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large-scale farms-Farms with a value of farm products sold of 
$100,000 or more (class 1a) have been designated as large-scale 
farms. Data for these farms classified by type of farm are 
presented in State table 30. 

Change in the classification of farms by economic classes-The 
above definitions of economic classes apply to the 1964 census as 
well as to 1969. There was a change from 1959 to 1964 which 
affected only class 6 and part:time farms. Discussion of this 
change can be found on page A 14 of appendix A of volume I of 
the 1964 census. In 1959, a farm was classified as class 6 if it had 
a value of sales of $50 to $2,499, the operator was under 65 
years of age and did not work off the farm 100 days or more in 
the census year, and the income from sources other than the 
farm operated did not exceed the value of farm products sold. 
Other conditions being the same, if the income from other 
sources exceeded the value of farm products sold, the farm was 
classified as part-time. 

Farms by type-The type of farm represents a description of the 
major source of income from farm sales. To be classified as a 
particular type, a farm must have sales of a particular product or 
group of products amounting in value to 50 percent or more of 
the total value of all farm products sold during the year. 

The count of farms by type is shown in State table 9, for all 
farms, for several groups of farms with sales of less than $2,500, 
and for abnormal farms. It is shown by county for class 1-5 farms 
in chapter 3 of section 1 of this volume. 

Type-of-farm breakdowns are reported in detail for class 1-5 
farms in State tables 28 and 29. 

The types of farms, together with the products (value of sales 
reported representing 50 percent or more of total value of all 
farm products sold during the year) on which type classification 
is based, are as follows: 

Cash-grain-Corn, sorghums, small grains, soybeans for beans, 
cowpeas for peas, dry field and seed beans and peas. 

Tobacco-Tobacco. 

Cotton-Cotton and cottonseed. 

Other field crop-Peanuts, potatoes (Irish and sweet). sugar­
cane for sugar or sirup, sweet sorghums for sirup, broomcorn, 
popcorn, sugar beets, mint, hops, sugar beet seed, and 
pineapples. 

Vegetable-Vegetables. 

Fruit and nut-Berries, other small fruits, tree fruits, grapes, 
nuts, and coffee. 

Poultry-Chickens, chicken eggs, turkeys, and other poultry 
products. 

Dairy-Dairy products-milk, cream, etc. The criterion of 50 
percent of total sales was modified in the case of dairy farms. 
A farm having value of sales of dairy products amounting to 
less than 50 percent of the total value of farm products sold 
was classified as a dairy farm, if-
a. Dairy products sold accounted for more than 30 percent of 

the total value of products sold, and 
b. Milk cows represented 50 percent or more of total cows, 

and 
c. The value of dairy products sold plus the value of cattle and 

calves sold amounted to 50 percent or more of the total 
value of all farm products sold. 
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Livestock other than dairy and poultry-Cattle, calves, hogs, 
sheep, goats, wool, and mohair except for farms in the 17 
western States, louisiana, Florida, Hawaii, and Alaska that 
qualified as livestock ranches. 

Livestock ranches-Farms in the 17 western States, louisiana, 
Florida, Hawaii, and Alaska were classified as livestock ranches 
if the sales of livestock, wool, and mohair represented 50 
percent or more of the total value of farm products sold, and 
if pastureland or grazing land amounted to 100 acres or more 
and was 10 times or more the acreage of cropland harvested. 

General-Field seed crops, hay, grass, and silage. A farm was 
also classified as general if it had cash income from three or 
more sources and did not meet the criteria for any other type. 

Miscellaneous-Nursery and greenhouse products, forest 
products, mules, horses, colts, ponies, fur-bearing animals, 
bees, honey, goat milk, and farms with no value of farm 
products sold. Also all institutional farms and Indian 
reservations. 

Stability in the classification of farms by type of farm-The type 
of farm classification for the 1964 census was the same as in 
1969. Only one minor change was made from 1959 to 1964. In 
the 19591isting of miscellaneous farms, fur-bearing animals, bees, 
honey, goat milk, and farms with no value of farm products sold 
were not listed as a part of this group. 

Detailed comparative data for farms classified by type of farm 
for 1959 may be obtained from State table 18 of volume I of the 
reports for the 1959 Census of Agriculture. 

9. DATA BASED ON REPORTS FOR A SAMPLE OF FARMS 

Published data for all farms combine the data for the 50-percent 
sample of small farms, weighted by "2," with the data for larger 
farms. Small farms are generally those with a total value of farm 
products sold in the year of less than $2,500. In addition to 
economic class 6, they include those farms classified as part time 
and part retirement. 

Farms orginally defined as "small" by the mailing list sources, 
but reporting a total value of farm products sold in 1969 of 
$10,000 and over, were tabulated with a weight of "1." 

For Wyoming, about 14 percent of the total farms were 
subjected to sampling. By final census classification, about 60 
percent of the small farms, as defined above, were subjected to 
sampling. 

For economic classes 4 and 5, the pen>~:<: Jes subject to 
sampling were 5 and 12 percent respectively.l he ,-emaining farms 
in these economic classes as well as all farms in economic classes 
1, 2, and 3 were selected with certainty. 

The proportion of total value of farm products sold from farms 
which were represented in the census by the sample was less than 
1 percent. 

All of the published data are subject to sampling and/or 
nonsampling error. Sampling errors, in general, do not signifi­
cantly affect totals since a very large proportion of the data were 
reported for economic classes 1 to 3 farms, for which there is no 
sampling error. 

Nonsampling errors, resulting from incomplete coverage, 
response errors, processing errors, and other sources are discussed 
in section 10. 



The sampling error for any published estimate can be approxi­
mated through the use of tables A, 8, and C. 

Table A indicates a "level" of sampling error for the number of 
farms reporting an item, and for magnitude items in broad 
categories for State and county tables. This table is used to 
determine sampling errors for State estimates. 

Table 8 classifies each county within the State as having "high," 
"medium," or "low" sampling errors, for the county as a whole 
and for small farms within the county. This table must be 
consulted first to determine sampling errors for county estimates. 

Table C presents the relative standard errors for estimated totals 
by number of farms reporting the item, according to the levels 
determined from tables A and B. 

Table C shows percentage limits such that the chances are 68 out 
of 100 that the difference between an estimate based wholly or 
in part on a sample of farms and the figure that would have been 
obtained if the information had been collected and tabulated for 
all farms would be no more than the percentage specified. The 
chances are about 99 out of 100 that the difference would be less 
than 2 1/2 times the percentage given in table C. The percentage 
given in table C takes into account the fact that data for the 
items listed were collected for all farms with a value ot farm 
products sold of $10,000 or more. 

The use of the tables may be illustrated by the following example: 
In a hypothetical State, 1,900 farms reported 5,068,000 bushels 
of corn harvested for grain on 62,100 acres. Table A shows that, 
for the State, measures for cropland harvested and for bushels of 
corn harvested have sampling reliability at level "1." 

Since table C for our hypothetical State doesn't show a value for 
1,900 farms reporting, we use straight-line interpolation to 
obtain a relative standard error of 7/10 percent. The standard 
error of the estimate of 5,068,000 bushels is then about 36,000 
bushels. For the number of acres of corn harvested, the standard 
error is about 435 acres for an estimate of 62,100 acres. The 
number of farms reporting corn harvested is also a sample 
estimate, and its level from table A ("Farms having the item") is 
level "2," so that the standard error on an estimate of 1,900 
farms is about 9/10 percent (using the line for 2,000 farms) or 17 
farms. 

At the 99-percent confidence level, the estimate of 5,068,000 
bushels of corn harvested for grain may have an error of as much 
as 90,000 bushels (2 1/2 times 36,000) which means that the 
production determined in a complete census would most likely 
be between 4,978,000 and 5,158,000 bushels. For the number of 
farms reporting corn harvested, the 99-percent level corresponds 
to an estimate with a standard error of 42 farms, so that the 
number of farms actually having corn harvested is probably 
between 1,858 and 1 ,942. 

Table A. Level of Sampling Reliability of State and County Totals for Selected Items 

State tables County tables 

Economic class Total farms Small farms 

Part 
Total Small Part retire-
farms farms t1me ment H1gh Med1um Low High Med1um Low 

Farms having the item •• •• ••••••••••••••• all farms •• 2 4 3 2 
large farms •• 

Land in farms ••.•.•.••••••••••••••••.•.•• ~ •• acres •• 7 6 7 7 6 5 7 6 5 
Value of land and buildings, ••••••••..•.•. dollars •• 2 6 5 6 5 4 5 4 3 
Owned and rented land .•••.•.•••••... ,,.,.,, .acres •• 7 1 5 6 6 7 6 5 7 6 5 
Cropland .•••••••••••.••.. , • , •••• , •.••. , .. , .• acres •• 6 3 6 6 6 5 4 6 5 4 
Harvested cropland ••••••. , ••.••••..••••••. , .acres •• 1 5 5 4 3 5 4 
Woodland •••••••••••••••• , • , • , •••••••• , •••••• acres. , 6 7 6 6 5 4 7 6 5 
Irrigated land o o o o. o ••••• o o •••••••• o ••• o o •• acres .• 1 2 5 4 3 2 4 3 

Total value of products sold ••• , ••..• , ••• , dollars •• 5 5 5 4 3 5 4 3 
Crops. o o o o ••• o o o. o o o ••••••••• o •••• ,, •• ,dollars,. 5 5 5 4 3 5 3 
Forest products ••• o o. o o o. o o o •• o •• , ••••• dollars •• 6 5 4 3 4 3 
Livestock products •• o •• o •••••••••••••• ,dollars .• 5 5 3 2 3 

Farm production expenses o o o • o •• o o ••• o ••••• dollars. o 2 5 4 3 5 4 
Commercial feed ••• o o .................... dollars •• 6 3 6 6 4 3 6 5 4 
Cornmerc ial fertilizer •••••. o •••••• o •••• dollars o o 5 5 5 3 5 3 
fuel •• o o o o ••••••••••• o •••••••••••• o •••• dollars. 0 5 2 5 5 5 5 4 3 5 
Hired labor. o o o. o •• o •••••• o ••• o. o. o o ••• dollars o. 6 2 3 6 6 6 6 5 4 6 5 4 

Machinery and equipment o o •••••• o. o •• o •••• o .number., 2 4 4 4 4 3 1 4 3 
Estimated market value. o. o. o o o o. o, ••••• dollars. o 6 3 6 6 6 4 3 6 5 4 

Livestock: 
Cattle and calves .. o. o. o o o • o •••••••• o ••• number •• 5 5 5 3 3 Hogs and pigs ...... o • o o ••• o o •• o ••••••••• number •• 6 6 5 5 4 3 6 5 4 
Poultry ............•• o • , • o ••••••••• , • , •• number •• 5 5 5 3 5 ~ 3 

Crops harvested: 
Corn for grain ....• o ••••••••••••••••••• bushels •• 5 5 5 5 3 2 5 
Potatoes ..•....•. o ••••• o •••• o. o •••••••• bushels •• 5 5 5 4 3 5 3 Wheat· ........... o ••• o. , ••• o ••••••••••• bushels. o 2 5 5 4 3 6 3 
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Table B. Classification of Counties Into Sampling-Error Category 

All farms 

High Medium Low 

Albany Big Horn 
Converse Cumpbell 
Fremont Carbon 
Hot Springs Crook 
Johnson Goshen 
Natrona Laramie 

Niobrara Lincoln 
Park Sweetwater 
Platte Teton 
Sheridan Uinta 
Sublette Washakie 

Weston 

High 

Hot Springs 
Johnson 
Niobrara 

Small farms 

Medium 

Albany 
Big Horn 
Campbell 
Carbon 
Converse 
Crook 

Fremont 
Goshen 
Laramie 
Lincoln 
Natrona 
Park 

Platte 
Sheridan 
Sublette 
Uinta 
Washakie 
Weston 

Low 

Sweetwater 
Teton 

Table C. Sampling Reliability Based on Number of Farms in Sample and Level of Reliability 

Level I Level 2 Level 3 
Number of farms for item: 

10· farns ... , ...........• 10 13 18 

20 fanns, •• , ..••..•.• , •• 7.1 9,0 13 

50 fanns •••• , •••.•••.••• 4.5 6,0 8.0 

100 fanns •••.•..•••••••• 3.2 4.2 5.6 

200 farms •••••••••.••••• 2.2 3,0 4.0 

500 fanns ••.•••••••••••• 1.4 1.8 2.6 

1,000 fams., .•........• 1.0 1.3 1.8 

2, 000 farms ••.•••••••••• 0.7 0,9 1.3 

5, 000 fanns •••••••••• , •• 0.5 0.6 0.8 

10,000 fams .•.......•.• 0.3 0.4 0.6 

20,000 farms ••••.••••.•• 0.2 0.3 0.4 

50,000 farms ...•••..•••• 0.1 0.2 0.3 

10. NONSAMPLING ERRORS IN THE REPORT 

Errors from causes other than those related to sampling are 
present in any census or survey. These can arise from a variety of 
reasons, such as inability to obtain any response from some 
farmers on the mailing list, incorrect reporting, processing errors, 
etc. 

One source of nonsampling error is present in the failure of some 
respondents to provide all the information requested. Special 
studies using a small national sample indicate that, on questions 
such as total value of farm products sold, the nonresponse rate 
may be of the order of 12 percent. It is usually possible to 
develop a figure for value of sales based on other entries such as 
production of crops, livestock sold, etc., but the figure so 
produced may not be as reliable as a direct report from the 
farmer. 

There is considerable undercoverage of small farms, due to the 
fact that a large number of these were either not included or not 
identified as associated with agricultural operations in any of the 
administrative records and consequently were not on the final 
mailing list. On the other hand, some farms were on the mailing 
list more than once, and while duplication was eliminated to a 
very large extent in the processing, some duplication remains, 
particularly for new farms or farms whose ownership status 
changed during the period when the list was being developed. 
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Relat1ve standard error (percent) 

Level 4 Level 5 Level 6 Level 7 Level 8 Level 9 

24 32 43 56 75 100 

17 22 30 40 53 71 

11 14 19 25 33 45 

7,5 10 13 18 24 32 

5,3 7.1 9.0 13 17 22 

3.4 4.5 6.0 8.0 11 14 

2.4 3.2 4.3 5.6 7.5 10 

1.7 2.2 3.0 4.0 5.3 7.1 

1.1 1.4 1.9 2.5 3.3 4.5 

0.8 1.0 1.3 1.8 2.4 3.2 

0.5 0.7 0.9 1.3 1.7 2.2 

0.3 0.5 0.6 0.8 1.1 1.4 

The total error of the census is a combination of the sampling 
and nonsampling errors. When the sampling errors are small, as in 
the case of economic classes 1 to 3 which have no sampling error, 
or for the whole State, for most counties, and for most magnitude 
items, the nonsampling error is usually the larger part of the total 
error. 

11. AVAILABILITY OF DATA FOR AREAS OTHER THAN 
COUNTIES AND STATES 

This report presents data only for ·the State and for counties 
within the State. 

Summary data for the United States, regions, divisions, and 
States will be shown in volume II. 

Unpublished tabulations of some of the data in State tables 24 
through 29 can be obtained for State parts of 99 agricultural 
subregions to which the counties in the conterminous States 
have been allocated. A charge will be made for the cost of review 
for consistency and disclosure of data for individual farms. 
Information regarding the availability of unpublished data may 
be obtained by writing to the Chief, Agriculture Division, Bureau 
of the Census, Washington, D.C. 20233. 
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COUNTY REPORT TEXT 
PLEASE KEEP THIS SHEET. It provides background information, definitions, 
and explanations including those for the "see text" notes in the tables. 

Individual County Reports 

Separate eight-page reports are published for all counties in the 
United States with 10 farms or more. Data are reported for the 
year 1969, with inventory (on place) figures as of December 31, 
1969. Comparable figures from the 1964 census are also 
reported. 

Information covering all farms in the county is presented in the 
first eight tables. 

Information covering farms with sales of farm products in 1969 
amounting to $2,500 or more (economic classes 1 to 5) is 
reported in substantially greater detail in tables 9 through 26. 

The same format is used for every county and State; the crop and 
livestock items reported in these tables are those which are 
relatively important in a matority of the counties in the United 
States. 

County Data for Miscellaneous Crop and Livestock Items 

Data for additional crop and livestock items, not common to a 
large number of counties, are reported in a separate set of county 
tables for each State. 

State Reports (Volume I) 

State totals of the data 1n the county reports are publtshed tor 
each State. 

In add1t1on, data lor each State are shown in a separate report 
consisting of one book or more. Chapter 1 ol sectton 1 presents 
ftndmgs at thl: Statu level 111 much more detail than IS published 
<Jt th(; county level. 

County data appear in the State teports as follows 

• A limttr.d amount of county "data are reported m summary 
lorm m chaplet 2 of sect ton 1. These tables list the counties in 
itlphabctical urdcr and report selected items for each. 

• lite cmtttly data for mtscellaneous crop and livestock items 
and the number of farms by "type of farm" for all class 1 5 
latmsareteported tnchapter3ol secttort 1. 

• A complete set of county reports makes up section 2. 

How the 1969 Census of Agriculture Was Taken 

The Mailing List-During the last week of December 1969, the 
1969 Census of Agrtculture forms were mailed to a list 
representing, as nearly as possible, all persons and firms 
associated with the direction of agricultural operations in 1969. 
The list included land owners, tenants, renters, sharecroppers, 
and hired managers, but excluded hired farm laborers. 

The mailing list was assembled from various administrative 
records including names and addresses from the 1964 Census of 
Agriculture, the Internal Revenue Service, the Social Security 
Administration, and the Agricultural Stabilization and 
Conservation Sc:vice. 

The ftnal ltst was constructed by merging and undupltcatmg the 
vartous ~ource ltsts. Addttional dupltcates not identtfted in th1s 
process were removed during data processtng. Coverage is more 
fully dtscussed 111 the text for volume 1. 

The Census Forms and Their Distribution-A standard 1 2-page 
form vvas sent to all operators expected to have 1969 sales of all 
agricultural products of $2,500 ancl over. 

A lour-pa~]e form went to a 50 percent sample of the operators 
whose 1969 sales were expected to total less than $2,500. Data 
in the "All Farms" tables are, consequently, subject to a small 
sampling variation. Tables of sampling variation will be included 
in volume I. 

Followup Procedures-A series of to II ovvu r> letters brought 
response to vvf'li over the qo 1wru:nt f,'vt:l bv .l1tlv 1. 1970 At this 
point, field followup enumeration was conducted in 370 counties 
l1avin~1 low response rates to complete the collection of data for 
those counties. 

To insure receiving reports from all large operattons, telephone 
<mel ltf'ld lollovvup vv<ts stdrtecl edrly 111 M,1rc!1 Thts wcx~ wc~s 

continued until reports were ubt<mwd. 

Standard statistical procedures were used, when possible, to cleal 
with inconsistencies or inadequate information in filled-out 
forms, including any short forms reporting sales of $2,500 or 
more. \NhQn these methods were not adequate, letters and phone 
calls were 11sed to secure the needed information. 

A more detailed description of procedures and definitions will 
appear in volume I. 

For sale by the Bureau of the Census, Washington, D.C. 20233 or any U.S. Department of Commerce field office. Price, including 8-page county report. 25 cents. 
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Comparability of Data 

This is the first census of agriculture conducted primarily by 
mail. The mailings were made just before January 1, 1970, and 
the information collected was intended to cover the full year, 
1969. The data collection phase lasted through September 1970. 

Prior censuses were taken by enumerators; the field work for 
1964 was largely completed in November and December of the 
census year. 

These two differences (use of mail and timing) affect the 
comparability of data from the 1969 census with data from 
earlier censuses. In a number of tables, 1969 inventory figures are 
shown, respondents were asked to report these as of December 
31, 1969. Where similar figures from the 1964 census are shown, 
they are as of the time of enumeration. 

"Farms," defined in the 1969 census exactly as in 1964, are 
places on which agricultural operat1ons were conducted at any 
time during the census year under the control of an individual 
management. Places of less than 10 acres were counted as farms 
if the sales of agr icu ltu ra I products for the year amounted, or 
normally would amount, to at least $250. Places of 10 or more 
acres were counted as farms if the sales of agricultural products 
for the year amounted, or normally would amount. to at least 
$50. 

Farms 1r: the top five economic classes (separately reported in 
tables 9 through 26) are those for which the sales of farm 
products 1n 1969 amounted, or normally would amount, to at 
least $2,500. Abnormal farms are excluded. 

Abbreviations and Symbols 

The following abbreviations ansJ symbols may occur in the tables. 

X 
NA 

z 
D 

Not applicable. 
Not avai I able. 
Reported in small fract1ons. 
Data withheld to avoid disclosure of information for 
individual farms. 

The "See Text" References in the Tables 

Table 1. "All other cropland" includes cropland used for 
soil-improvement crops, crop fa1lure, cultivated summer fallow, 
and idle cropland. 

"All other land" includes pastureland other than cropland and 
woodland pasture, rangeland, and land in house lots, barn lots, 
ponds, roads, wasteland, etc. 

Table 3 for Southern States. For 1964, the data reported in the 
columns headed "Negro operated farms" include all nonwhite 
operators. 

Table 4. "Class 6 farms" have a value of farm products sold of 
$50 to $2,499 and a farm orerator under 65 years of age who 
did not work off the farm 100 days or more in the census year. 
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"Part-time farms" have a value of farm products sold of $50 to 
$2.499 and a farm operator under 65 years of age who worked 
off the farm 100 days or more in the census year. 

"Part-retirement farms" have a value of farm products sold of 
$50 to $2,499 and an operator 65 years old or over. 

"Abnormal farms" include institutional farms, experimental and 
research farms, and Indian reservations. Institutional farms 
include those operated by hospitals, penitentiaries, schools, 
grazing associations, government agencies, etc. 

"Market value of all agricultural products sold" represents the 
market value, before taxes and expenses, of all agricultural 
products sold in the census year, including livestock and poultry 
and their products, crops including nursery prod:Jcts and hay, 
forest products, and all miscellaneous farm produc;ts. The figures 
include landlord's and contractor's shares. 

Table 5. "Farm production expenses, total" for 1964 is the sum of 
specified expenditures and does not include those listed as "NA" 
in the table. 

"Other agricultural chemicals" includes all herbicides, fung1cides. 
other pestic1des. growth-control chemicals, and defoliants used 
for crops, and msecticides for I ivestock and pou I try in the census 
year, including any of these materials paid for by landlords, 
contractors, and custom operators. 

Table 7. 1964 f1gures on sales of broilers are based on a quest1on 
which had no spec1flcation regard1ng age. 

Table 8. "Land in orchards" includes land in bearing and 
nonbearing fruit orchards, citrus or other groves, vineyards, and 
nut trees of all ages, including land on which the fruit crop failed. 
It does not include acres in abandoned plantings or data for 
places with less than 20 fruit or nut trees. 

Table 9. "All other land" includes house lots, barn lots, ponds, 
roads, wasteland, etc. 

Table 13. "Market value of all agricultural products sold." See 
note for table 4. 

"$1 to $2,499." In the processing, certain farms were identified 
whose operations would normally have a sale of farm products of 
$2,500 or more, but had actual sales of less than $2,500 in 1969. 
These farms are grouped with class 1-5 farms for the more 
detailed tabu lations reported in tables 9 through 26, and are 
included in class 5 whenever f1gures are shown separately by 
class. They are included in the appropriate value groups having 
sales of less than $2,500, in table 4. 

Table 14. "Farm production expenses, total" and "Other 
agricultural chem1cals." See notes for table 5. 

In 1964, contract labor was included with machine hire and 
customwork. 

Table 16. See note for table 7. 

Table 20. "Land in orchards." See note for table 8. 

Table 24. "Land in orchards." See note for table 8. 



Regular Report Form 

().$. ,DEPMlTfitf!NT OF CO..,MERCe 
BV~f!4l.J OF THE CltNSIJ.& 

ClffSUf 01. AeRI(U,IURI ~ 1969 

Response- to rhis inquiry is required by law (fide 13, 
US. Code). By rbe .&ame law your rt•port to tbe Ceo:; us 
Bureau is confjdential h may be seen only bf, 1~(1fn 
C:ensus emplore-es .and m~y b~ used on!.~· lo:stattst.t~al 
l'Utposes. The law also pro'>'Jdes rhat copa•.!i ret:uned 
m your fifes are irnmu_nc from Je-gal process. 

P·leo>oo mention lhe. ·conou l'tto.Nim!~•; (tho ten•lf!glt numb4tdtitbe. upper leltcorno' 
ol th• -addreu: 14bt~ll H ;~"OU wrf-t• ,tO.J.I• ab-put th'l'.e r.eport , , 

34 

None 

• Please answer the questions on chis form 
and rerum it in the enclosed envelope- as 
soon as you can, preferably not later than 
February 15, 1970, 

• Only one repo<t is required for your agri­
cultural operations. I( more r:han one reporc 
is received, please wdre "Exua Copy" 
across the top of the first page of each 
additional report and return it along w .ith 
the report you coroplere. 

• Please give the best answers you can 
Make an estimate if you do not have the 
actual number. 

e The enclosed leafier illustrates how to 
enter your answers and contains helpful 
information about the questions. Please 
read the Leaflet Introduction, then use the 
leaflet, as needed, while you are complet­
ing your report. 

·--. Your estimate of the 
~urrent mo-rket value of these 

Acres acres and th-e buildings o,. thern 
CENTS NOT REQUIRED 

Dollars 1 Cents 

Ot4 OfS 

s ' 
' 

1. Lli·nd o"'lled., .. , •.. , •. , .. ·, .• , ,., .• , ... , •• , • , , • , , . , , , .. , , . , , , , CJ 
016 Of7 I 

' 
I 

s ' 

2. Land rented· or leased from others - lncluclelaad trorktd on shares, kased 
Fe{ler<tf, State. and. railroad.> land; ctnd l!Jnd ut:ed real free. fDa not incl~tde None 
la.n4·us.ed 011: Cl per· /lead basis ·unde.r a· grlkin!f permit.;. , , • , • , , , •. , . , • . 0 

018 019 ' 
s ! 

I 

3, Ls;tid renred or leas~d tc> others - h!.ctll!li! .lluul suiJ~ect a1!4 land u:orked None 
· ·"!I sh<>r~s by othe:~s .. , •.• , •• , • , •• , ·' , , , • ·, • , -. , • , , , , , ••• , ... , .. , , , C 

4, J ot~'l ~cr•5 - Plea~e APP .... ~,..~ ~Wirllil (item J)to ~res rented (item 2), then ..llo... 
ru20 These ore the ACRES in 

"THIS PLACE" 
for this census report SIJBTRACT "~,•~. re~fed to ofhers'~{itfm 1), iitrtl /fiiiJ!r -,ovr answer in fhi$ space ,.-

S. }lgw many acres in THIS PLACE·111eri!divened Wjder soil baJ)k or other Federal None 021 
programs· ~~h ~ ·rh9:Se fol: fe<!d gains, wheat, etc;?·, .•• ; . , •..•.... • , , , , , , • , . C Acres 

6. W~<e •l!ierio •ny re~.) ;~state ro~rtgages, deeds· of UU~>t, o:c land purchase ~ootracts 022 
. on "!If part of the lanll and buiJdinB" you own? ...• , , .••.• , _., ...• , , ... , . , . t C Yes 2 C No 
7>-iiow m<lilY persot)s rente<! eT leased' land ftoro.y9u. ill 1969? -,fnctutle those None Ol!3 

wqrkJ!Ig kiilil (in .&ttcires. · : ., •• , · •• , •..•• , ••••. ; , '· •.•.••••• , '· . , , •. , • C _____ Persons 

None 
8~ lfl>w .M.ny acr~s.;of ih.~ li!II~ you ~oted orlea~ed UOlJI othi!~ (item 2) did you 

liubrent 'l!r· su\)le<.Se.~o orn~s; ~·biel)!de land re.nted or leaBej! btl !lou which 
IC!tS ll"Qr/!ed on s.h:ares .Wotllers • •. , • , •• , •• : •.• , , , ••• , , , , • , , • , . , , • , , • C: ____ Aeres 

~------~~--------------------------
. 9: If you rented !~rid from oth'~ (i!t~ro. 2X give the)ollowittg 

· hlforrnat!on by type ofbln<l ~wnep;lilp~ . ·· .. , . · 

o\JneJISI\~ oi ~and 
yQ.\t·ren'te!i fiol!r otM.rs 

· (~C'~Qvn! (!>< cd laC...s · 
.. rei>o~Jed In item 2) · 

.;, lnc!lNi.d.w.!s, -f'l'titl~i:·.· 
· .~~lis, est\i.tl!ll : ;\~ • ·~;;;;.,.----t...--~*""--;,.,......,-+;,~-+-~-1 

, b,· c~~oradoli;-ii!il:lulk 
. "«f4iQ~d rn~J! .• '· . , . h=.----

'Pk44e """ .... 
You may be able to skip most of this form if-

a. AU the land you own or rent is rented ro someone else 
b. There We<e no crops or livestock in 1969 on the land 

tepo~~ted in item 4 

Before continuing please read "SHOULD YOU COMPLETE nus 
FO~" in'L·eaflet, Section 1, Part C . 

- J.;OCAfUTR o.f aerleultwal activity In 1969 
l. Art> 4U of your .agrieul~al operatiorts located in the county 

·ShQWa in W upper riaht corner of the adclress label? 

0 l'!o - Complate tb;, it111n 

.Wr~te name a11d acres for p!lioci~l county on the fitst line; 
. C Ye& _ \V'flte l'u.unes anti acres for additional counties in spaces 
. GQ to provided. If necessary, continue in Remarks on page 12. 

ttem: 2 Nome of c:ouoty S.tote Acres 
h•l"w ~dnclp•l r---.:.=:.:.co:.c==---t...::.="-..1-:o:::a::::•=='--­

.,_,nty 

··Other 
. .~;Quntie,, 

. . .. '.· . . :t.ot~t(cu:.r·~· rM~st eq~of acres In-
. · .. , .; '·. _- . <: . .s:ecTIOn l, i'te.m 4) 

··t.9.e•ti.~.,·w;th{~ l'olliiry o.t your p!lincipal agricultural operations. 

'. O"tiM lp,.diaith:t, .~recinct. etc.:... See Leotler. s.-ction 2. 

Bl 
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Regular Report Form-Continued 

Section 3 - Land USE in 1969 

Reminder: 
If the same land 
was used for two 
or more purposes, 
report that land 
only once - in 
the first item 
that applies. 

Please check: 
If the acres 
for item 5 
do not agree 
with the acres 
shown in 
section 1, item 4, 
please read 
Leaflet, section 3, 
and check your 
.entries. 

The purpose of this section is to ·distribute all 'l<:tes in thi$:pLace i>'!long items 1 rhrough 4. 
Please react Leaflet, section-3, h!_0!!.2n.-u>erinq i.t~.-- . .. · -------·-~-----·---
1. Cropland . · · . · . : · · . , 

o. Cropland harvested - [!!elude· aU land from lf)hich crovs· u:ere hqrve5•tcd or. hay u;as cltt, and 
aU land !n orc/1ards, citrus uroz•es. ·vineyards: aurt!jur~ery·ct~d ureenhollsc products . , , . , , , 

b. Cropland used only for pasture or grazing . · .•... ·. '·· ... , , . , , . , , .. · , : , , .. 
c. Cropland used for cover crops, legumes, and. soll·improvem~·nt "grasses, 

but not harvested and not pastured .......... ·: . . , .. · •.• , , .... , .... . 
d. Cropl<~nd on which all crops .failed (!';:.r;ception,: Do -not report Mre land in orchards 

anl:! t>ineyards on takich the ~rop Jailed .. S:UGk acreart~ is tQ Qe r0ported in item La.)' . : .. 
' ' 

••· Cropland in cultivated summer fall.ow .... .' .•.......• ·. , ... '" : .. , ..... , . , ..... . 

f. Cropland idle .... , .............. , .·, , ............ · .... . 

2. \Voodland- Tncludc here all woodlots and·timber tracts: and cutoQer and 
aetorested land witT• voung timber ·growth: 

a. Woodland pastured , , .... , ....•..... , ..•. , .. , .. , , •...... , ..... 
. 046 

Acres 

Acres: 

Acres 

A<:res 

_______ Acres 

b. Wood!Md 'not pastu;ed / , .. , ....... ' .. , ••. · ..•... , ... · .. ,·. , •.... , .. , ...... '1-------"A:.::c:..:r•:::...• 

3. Other paswr~land and rangeland - Include here anv .pasi.W'e other than cropland ancl woodland pw;tu:re. 
o. Pasture land and rangeland improved ·by Jll)>ing, .fert{Jizing, seeding; irrigaoing 

draining, or controlling weeds and brush , .. , .... , .. , . , , .... : . , . , ............ . 

b. Pasture land and range land not improved .••................... , , ... ; .•.. , .. 
4. All other land- Include hare anv l<!ncl not reported cibove. · 

a. Land in house lots, bani)ots, ponds, roads, wasteland, etc, , , .•........ , .•.... , . 

' . 
5. Total acres in this place- PleM.e add tfte acres iU,items t.t/trouuh 4 and enter the total i·n tlt.is space_.,. 

(This total should be the same as the total in section 1, ite)ll 4. J 

050 

0$1 

0:S2 

Section 4- Has any LAND In this place been IRRIG:AtEb at'any tl~ durlQ& the 5 years since January I, 1965? 

053 
1 DYes - Complete this. section 

zONo­
Go to 

].and irrigated in 1969 None 
1. How many acres of land in this pl<~ce were.lnlgated at any ~i!Tle i'n 1969?· , ......• , , . , . C 

054 

A er-os 

Secflon 5 2. How many acres of -
· 1/"Nonc." go to Section .5 . '0'55------

Q. Cropland harvested (repented in 'section :J,,item ta) were irrigated? .•..............•.. 

b. Cropland used only for pasture ·_o~ grazing (reported in sectio11, 3, item lb) were irrlgared? .. ; .. 

c. Orher pasture land (teporteil.in ~eotion :J, item 3a) were irrigated? 

d. Any other lands were irrigated? "'--Spect/11 lcin<( use ______________ _ 

Method of irrigation iq 1969 . . 

3. How ma,ny acres were -irrigaud in'l969 by 'each. of.the following methods - !If more (han one. 
meth.od u:as tcsed on ·M.e same field the total-of ·these ac.res U.'ilL be greater tl!an item 1 abore.J 
a, Spiinklers 1 ......•..• · :_ ..•... • •.. , • · ..•....•. : ; . · · · • :. • . · . ' · . · . • · • · · · · • • 

b. Furrows or ditches? .... , .. , .. ·., ; .... ': .' .• , . ' •..• .' ... : .... ;,, . , ......... ', .• 

c. Flo.oding? ... , ...• ·; ..• , • ,, _, •.• _, ..•..•..•• , ... , ... · •• , .• · .. : •.••. , ... 

d. Subirri-gation? (\Vater appfieci b/Jlou;.jrou!id S·UT[ace, 0~· at!i'!icial.control Of QTOU7!d waten 

Source of water ild969 . . · . 
4, Whar percent of lrrlgatiot.:.,)Vate.r used ln1•9(S9·•\va$·;_ (Pll:<lse _be .silre the tOtaL percentpges reporlcil 

tn questions a throUrJh c e1llml100%. · For othet WO.V'S.'of estiwqtinlf 1!Uiltttit1f, of u·ate~. sea J.,eail£t, &IWtion 1.1 
a, From a w.ell or spdllg o.n· thl~ placcf? ·, ; ••• ·• : ••••• , • ; . · •.... , , ·.,. :· , · .. , , .•. · .. , . · .. 
b. From a surface fi.!pply not controHed:il;iy•a·war<ir sl)pply otg'ID.iz~tion· (stream, 

drainage dhcb,lllke,pond,.or resetv.oi; on or.adjacent'.rothis place)'?.:_, .... , .. ,.,·, ... ·. 
c. From wate.r suppliers?. ril:futual, llrh•<!tli., CiOoperatit>e or neiohbothoori dl'tches, lrrton.tion 

district, commercial company, mttniciptu 6~ co'ln-nmntty ·water system, or anot/ler.Jarm J 

Give rtame ,t\nd addte,St· 6( eaCh wat~r supg{le.r, ' " 
('Use "Remarks." pao:e 12 if more space' is needed.) 

!. .2. 

Estimated quantity of watet used in· 1969 · . · : .: : , 

Acres 

55 

Aeres 
~------

Acru 
ose 

Acres 

0$9 

Acres 
'060 

Ac;res 

U61 

Acres 

osz 
Acres ., 

0'63 

Percent 
064 

Pfm::enr 
065 

P~rcen1 

5. Plellse estimate die <(\lanthy of WaGer U!tl!>d.fofirdgatioiHn W69 ~ . . .. '. . . Ae,o-leet'Tanths_ 
(Report in tMi unit or 'awits of 11teasure most qQnlleillil.nt 1or !lou. See :Le;Mlet, sectimi 4. x o~6 
a. Aere-feer.(One qcre·tootcovers .. on.e (I,Cre,·alle,loot:dMPJ .• : .. : ..... ,.; . ; •. , •· ... > .... , . -10 

. .. ·. ' . · .. · :'.· .. :' . . · .... ·•··. ,.·.. . ·.. . ·,(. '. : •0$7 

(>. G11!1ons tPtim.pmg· caplicitu.:P'er m~nute X.!i04il~nuteil JJ :/tours Oj)eratedin seasO!IL • , •..• ~. , ••• b,.----.....;;;G.:;.o;;cll:::•";:;..' 

c, If acre~~et or pllons cannot .be. esllmated 1n a or '1>: abo,e, &ive .bOth' inc;bes applied and acres C:overed . . oea 
(l)Deptha·t>Plle<i. •. • • · • • · • · • ,:; · •..•.. ,r. -'.· ··• ·. • • · ···.'· • · ·,:. · •'' ·' · '.'' •: '· · · '·.• ·: 069 

loch•• 

(2) -"'"a covered ·, •• i, • ... , , , , ; , .' i : ...... ; • ·.·., ;·,.,. ,·, • ·. ,·, .: • .. , • ~ • , , ..••• ·, •• 'L;;._;.. ____ :oA,c,e• 

FORM O!i•AII-'41 l!'i•!i•6<)1 



Regular Report Form-Continued 

. . 
Sea.tlon S..; Is any kANO tn lbls JJIJ~"IiARTIFICIALI.YDRAJrt~D? (fncluae dttalles, underorounri drains, orafltno tor draiMge, dtl«is, or 

. . · J!liiftpl!fig·t:d er,>ntto"l.wqter. £a:t;lulie 1!fuini1(Je·8.ole}l(ljor tM re111oval of trrioation waste water. See Leaflet, sectton 5.) 
070 . . / ..... ; . .. 

1 O l:t:s :... Compltt• fliU section .·. 
· · : · Pte~se uti!l'il>t¢ th¢:ae~~>fi draln~d:i!>y. eat!\ of the following systems but 

.. -!lo"notioctud.e the s~tn~· acrell"ge ~s dtaio~d l>y mote than one system. 

1, A h,rm sys.tef!l whi~h Js.lndependent of a11 otganized 
071 

Acr .. s artificially drained 

Totol 8y sysfems instcrlled 
since Jonuory 1, )969 

072 

dralria&e 4~tilct ot (!tbet puhlk 1>gency •...•...•..•.•••••.•.•..• (.,.,..,--------+,.,..-------
. • U7> 074 

2. A fatllj -s¥steill wbfcll ara"l95 into ~e ·system of an organized 
drainage 4isttlct or other p\lblic agency .•.......••••.•....•••..• ~-----~---!-::-~----~---

• . . 075 076 
3_. A sy<~tem lnscalU,<J en.~iuly by an.organi;red drainage 

district or other pul>lie agency •.•.••••..•..•.•.•.••....•....• 

S"tlpn 6 ~ Was any ·eommer~Ja!l FER1"11JZ£R applied" an PASTUR"ELAND In 1969? 
(Eio notindude lflnd from whiclt qrops were Ttarvested or Ttay cut.) 

CY t m fete th's s•ctlon es -:- 0 p I 

CNo-
G:o to 
Section 7 1-: Cropland· used only for pasture (reported·in 

section 3, ~tem tbl feail.ized ..•.•..•••...•.....•. 

2. Other pastureland (reported in 
~11cJiOi! 3, item 3a )·-fertilized . . • . • . • . . . • . . . . . . . . • . 

Aeros 
fertilized 

077 

080 

Section 7- Was CONTQUR l'l:ANTING, STRIPCROI'I'ING, or TERRACING In use on this place in 1969? 

0 Yes - Complete this section 

F"rtilizar used 

Dry L.iqoicf or goa-

Whole ton.s Tenths Who-le tons Tenths-
078 

' 
079 

iO -10' 
OS! 

' 
062 

.-(a 
' -10' 

083 

CNo~ 1. Grain or t\J.W crops fan:Ded on the contour • · · · • • • · · · • • · · • • • • · · • · · • · • · · • · • • . . . . Acres 
~~~4-------------------. Go to 

Section 8 2, Strlp.,ropping systems to control erosion ..............•....•..•............. ~os=s:-_______ A_c_~_•_ 

· 3. Cropland and pastureland having terraces . . . • . . . . • . . . . . . • . • . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Ac...,s 

Space ls provided in the next 6 pages for reporting alm<>st all the crops grown in any part of the United States. Similar 
"P~ 11-Ut{, • • • crops such as small grains, hay crops, vegetables, etc., are grouped in se.;:tions. If you did not harvest any of the 

~tops in a section, you can mark (X) the "NoH bo:t for the first quest.ion and skip to the next section. Please report 
_only w-hole acres and whole units of production except where space is provided for reporting tenths. Leaflet, «section 
_,8-23, '.' provides additional information and au example showing how to enter your answers. 

S~ctio~ 8 ,.. Wa.~ any FI.ELD C:ORN harves!ed far- any purpose from this place in 1969? 

C Yes· - Compflftt tbis $ection 

CNo..;. 
Got~;~_ . 
S~etion 9 1. Fi.el<! corn for grain -Report quantity harvested 

in one unit ortl!l - either bushels or /lundredweioht 

-Quontity harvested Acres 

ot shelled corn ........................ ln,;;:;------fr ... ------.:~~~:!.2!:.:!6,,...-----

2. Field com for silage ..••......•.•.•••... t-;,;-;;------~ 

3. Field corn .c-ut for gree.n or dry fodder, hogged or 
· grazed !Do not inl.'!ude here acres !llready reported 

tn item 1 or 2.1 •••.•.•• , ••••••..•....•. ..._ _____ _ 

095 

· 4. Comll)~<ci<!·l fertilizer used on field corn , .••••••.••.•• 

Acre$ 
lt>rtilized 

Fertili.z.er uaed 

D.·y Liquid or gas 
Whole tans 1 Tenths Whole tons 1 Tenths 

096 ./.:. 097 
10 

Secll.on 9 -·Were. any S·ORGIHI'!tlS bltlletted lor allY purpose from this place in 1969? !Include both grain and s10eet varieties. 
Do not report sorghum-sudan crosses in- this section.) 

C:::: Y.~s .:.. ConlJ>.Iete tltl~ i'ectlon 
Acre a Quantity harvested Acres 

c::::.w,­
~: .. !fo~ 1 .. 0 ' 1. s_;,~~~~~ms, iot ,g(aln or se~d - Rei>ort quantity 

· h.ahii!stect ~n·olle uni·t 911!!1 ,.. ettlter buslu!ls 
·. 9rfio'llni4::.: .............. ;; ...... ·IT!r:.-------t;n.------...:....:==---+......-------

2. ·sorgbum!dor sHage ..• , ••......•.••.•.. 
. : . ,_· ', . 

"' ,3. Sot~)lum.s c-ut for dry forall.e or hay : ..••• , ... 

. ' .4.. so~shpms lio,gged or g~a:a~d ('()o !lOt include here 
. . il(ll'iiS ·atreadl/. T<l!IOTted .. in items 1, 2, Or .1.) ••••• 

Fertilbor used 
A~:ros Dry Liquid or gas fertlli:uxl 

Whole ton• 1 Tenths Whole tona 1 Tenths 

. , 5. C-omme~le:l fortili.zer_. up~d on sorshums ....•...•..•. , . 
110 ,,, I 112 I 

I iO I --(a' I I 

Page ~ 
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Regular Report Form-Continued 

Section 10- Were any SMALL GRAINS harvtsled fllr.aralu·frpm Ibis place In 1869? 

C Yes - Complete this section 

CJNo­
Go to 
~ectlon 

CNo­
Go to 

1. Winte: ,.;heat 
2. Spring wheat oth<:t 

than durum , •••••••• ~ 
---+--------- -·---

3. Ourum wheat .••..••. '17:-::----+.-------::Z::!!!~,------+~------l--------'--_:__!_"-l-.---·· 1 ~ 
-~----

·~ -'•-------- -<·--

'· Barley for pin .. " .. ·~.----+.~---___.:::e~:t-;----~~----J..:.----:---~,.---~-~--(-'~~o­
~~k~ ~ --+-----+---- --·-----+--- -- .1-;---

7. :Mix<!d pins, 

8. Flallseed •••• , •..•. 

9. BucJcwheat ••••••... 

_ t. Soybal!s io~·.b~s · 

2. )l.,;n;u. itJ!. _n~s 

Al:ory Wrulli~~~~~--., •.•• -~ ·.~-::~---f~----=;;...,;,..,lk-----4~- ---+-----

5. ·oey Iiebl and'eted-11':-"~- ,b::a----11.-----=~~t.-------'6-----+------- ~­

~ 

'' c~ •• -~at~~:_, 'm=:------1:,------.;::l:l;:l::U:,ib'----t-----+,.------L--~~.-----L-~ 

S.ti#Jaq l3 ··.-

1:. Oa.~roa'· ••.•.•••. , • .-· •• :·, ·:11irr-----1r--·-----c.:~~ 

;r ri;~'(\_"1j,.-----+-------+ 
-~; ":~~~~~~ht:;~;rj{~ -,~;·:i;i;;.,;...----+,.___ ____ ..; 

: 6. lllado~ on 
fOAM r,~ Alll41 !1!1 !ii·~OI Page 4 



Regular Report Form-Continued 

ACre• 
hcuve•ted 

17<1 I 

'17 I 

172 I 

173 1 

1174 I 

17& ' 
176 I 

177 I 

178 I 

Acre a ,_,, ·fto:,.vested 

190 I 

..._ ... ,!!: ~ · ...... ~" .. "' ... ' .... , '0 ••• 

H~t , 

No. 

No. 

~2 1 

193 I 

\94 I 
. 

195 I . 
,196 I 

1 

·MJJIII No. 

:Kentulllly blueg~&ss s~~ed 
other thap Merion • , • • • 210 

lapine seed .. .. .. .. . • . Zit 
tted!<!p se.ed ; • • .. • .. • .. 212 
Ryeg~ass seed ......... zu 
Su1llm· grass. seed ........ 214 
'Hauy veieh ~aed • • • . • . . us 

A.cN.s 
ftntiliHd 

Qu4nfi1'y Ac-res 
harvested itrigoted 

Tons, 2 
dry 

Tons, 
2 

dry 

T011s~ 
dry 

2 

Tons, 
dry 

2 

Tons, 2 
dry 

Tons, 2 
dry 

2 
Tons~ 
dry 

Tons, 2 

9reen 

Tons, 2 

g"'en 

Quantity Acres 
haf've•ted irrlgGted 

Pounds, 
~leon seec 

2 

Pounds, 
cleorr seed 

2 

Pounds, 
clean seeel 

2 

Pounds, 2 

clean seed 

Pounds, 
c~on se•tl 

2 

Pounds, 2 

clean seed 

Potmds, 
2 

cleon seed 
2 

Pounds. 
cle~n seed 

2 
Pounth, 
cloan seed 

NIIIU No. 

Vetch seed, other 
than hairy .... ~ • .. .. .. • 216 

Wheatgt:ass seed ••••••• , 217 
All other seeds • , ....... 218 

(mlll•>t (N>l<toil), 
blues.tem, conarygross, 
flit::.)- Write name above 

Faftllt.tar used 
Dry Liq-uid or goa 

Wh~l• 
1,2 I o 
,~ Who I• ,-E 

''"" ~~ tons c 
lj! 

219 220 221 
sectionts.;. :-10 ,-:a 

B5 
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CNo-
Go to 
Section 2Q 
on page 7 

CNo-
Go to 
Section I& 

Regular Report Form-Continued 

l. Apples .. , , ; , •. ~ ........ "'. a4U --10 1 
1
2 ':'---- --~- ~~u~ai_.:. 

- ---· ll4'1'-' ~- ·_ .. 
2, Peael\es, cHngstone , ,_; ..• , ,.,·.-,. ..-(at· F-=12_ ---~---
, _ - . · . · . > fl142' ' ~ a· · 
l. Peacht!S., 'fteestl)Jti!' • -, •. , ... , : • , ._. -1c) · -e~•--:J~ 

/0 f;---·---- 2 -- ,3 -------~ 
4. Pears, Bat~e~t • .'.; ....... , , •· ... ~48 / 10 · ·.- · 

- - , . - - - .· ·. "z"'44;;-----'-------'"'+,,..------'.2-----~-~a--------~ Po~'f¥#·. 
-s. Pears_, otber.tb;an Bar.tlett ......... ~4$. --10. =t=---r.;------- P?VI'¢i. 

6. Chemes, ·ta:t ........... :. '.·. ..-(a 1 2 a eokpil{ 
1. Cherries, s-weet .• •.••..•. .- .... , ..• "'46 · ____,-;;,0 r,----- ,2 · ----~--r.a-------

- ~ ---~,.-~-·~•runil~~~· · 247 >I 2 "3_____ . • . 
8. Avocados (See Leaflet, seat'kin 17) , • 1 --1 o R J' 

~ 1 _/. I rr----- -rs--- oy? ~-- ·. 
9. Dat"s . . . • • • • . . • • • . . • • . • . • • 1 o '?··~"• · . - w-~=r,------ ~----------t-;;--------------~-~-

10. Grapes, Amertcan type .• , ..• ,., , . -1() 'Eoy~<j$ . 
11. Grapes, Eur'Qt>eail WI'!' _ . 1~ov 2 3 r- ~Tons·' · .. 

ct. Raisin van!'tie.s - Re1Jo•t ·QIU!ntity r.;-,------4 . or _;___::l_Q_~r'Jff ·. 
/!arvestect tn .qne unit only:-- either ---(o 10 ilr":r···: 
tom~ treJ>/! or'tons dr:d •••• _. <·. -~;2,..5,.----'-----;+,,-----h-2-----/:3:;-,----~-~~;;. .. 4_.,_,~ 

b. TableVJJtleti.es, •.•••..•. -_.. ~ "!;;;;.-·---~--____,-:;-'-l.::,Ol-:1'-. --------1-:;----- IOtTI>J.;;r,· 
W• ' • ,· . . '252 /1 2 -1':;------" ./: -•. . _· 

c. me.vanetle$· .... _. ... :,,.... 'io lOTs 
!,.------'---";ofr-------j'O"'------j;,-------' ,~t;)n ,· 

12. Plums ••••... , .•••.•••.•.••• I"~" ..-(a 1 a· h:~g'*:', 
~2~$~~-------4--~~r.---------~2~--------~3--------------~.qhJ~ 

13. Ptunes - Report qua111titv harves_ted 
l'n one unit 011Z1/-either·poul/4$ ..-(a [4'- -1'o 
fresh. or tons rl'f11 ••••••• , .•• , -. 'm,,;,------~-----,+-:-----~-=------~-=------·---

14. Apricots ..... ; ...•.. , ...... 255 ..-(a 1 2 --(a ro~• 
15. Olives (See Lea/let, secttQJ117): ; , ·• 256 ' -1() 1 2 · ~- io I9!!L.:-
16 F • - d 257 2 ·a - Pound,$. 

• igs - Report qu4ilttty ,tlrveste b- f.t.•~h • 
in one unit only·- eit/!er: vound_s io • 10 J?<ms, 
tresh. or tons rlru • ' ••••••••••••. ,_ ____ _..__-~. ___ _,.,._..~-____ __. ___ .._,....,......,._,..:::il';.,·• ._ ... 

Section 18- Were there any CITRUS FRUIT TRE~S on this-place In 1969? C!:lee Leaflet, sec:tion 18.1 

C Yes - Complete th/$ •eetlon 'T,:.e .. o.f- Oil' ag~.S · QuQrtHtr'lnafvtit.-a 
Aen•a T '" Nvnlher· ~ot ~T NVrn'bef.of In 96~_,.69 

1 .. nth.s ~•orlng age bearii'lg; ov• fro11>· bloom ol 19t8 

l'J No - I. Valenda oranges ••.......•••. 
Go fo 
Section 19 2. Navel oranges ..... , .••....•• 

270 I --10' 2- a 
Flf>lcJ ho>r•s 

:271 I -1()1 2 s· 
Fl«./# ·boxes 

3. Temple oranges .........•..• , : 
27'1., 

I -1{)1 2 3 
F ;eJd ·boxes 

4. Other oranges • . •... _. , ...•..•• 
273 

I ..-(a' z 3 
Pi-.1<1 boxu' 

5. Tangerines and mandari'ns ..•.... 
274 

I ---(o' 2 a 
·- Field bo••• 

6. Tangelos ...•.••.....•.•••. 
275 ..-(a' 2 a 

' 
I Fi.<>I.J boxes 

7. Gral"'fruit ..•....•......•.. 
2'1'6 ..-(a' I 

2 3 
F'(e/J box.,. 

8. Lemons ...................• 
27 -1()' 2 3 

Field b·oxos 

9. Limes ..•..•.••••. : •• · ...•. 
278 ---(o' 2 3 

Peon as I 

10. Kumquats .............•• , .. 
.2?9 -1()' 2' 3 

' 
I Pouncl1 

Report anu other citrus Jrldt trees tn tile space provided at t/le end of se.:tion) 9. 

Section 19- Were there any NUT TREES on this place in 1969'1 (See Lea/lei. section 19.) 

C y..,. - Complete this section 
Tree~ o(<dl G.fe!fo 

At:!!U ·I Tenth• Numb:e·r nQf'-q Nu.nber of Qu~ntity hO:rve.st.e~ 
b•arlng. aoe boor(ng. a'e 

C No - 1. W~<itJUts, English or Persian , •.•.• 
Go to 2 Section 2D . Almonds •• • ..• , • ' • • , ... ·- •.. 

3. Pecans,. impr<~ved .••..• , , •.. , 

J280 I --i'o f· 2 3 I -10 'tons I 

281 
I _.-(o1 2 3. ~__:(o 'I on• 

262 I ...-fo1 2 3, ·PovrtrJ$ 

4. Peo;11ns, wild and seedling ••. , ••• 
5. Fllberts and hazelbues .... , .... 

28_3 I -10' 2 s Pound• 
~ij4 I 

--i'o ' 2 3 ;Po11niis. I 

6. Tung nuts ...•• , . , ....•.... 
285 I -1(j1 2' s Pound a 

' 
·;,. hu$1< 

7. Other fruit and nut trees - Gtve name 2!16 I 1 a 3 
I 

--i'o I Pounds 

J·ORM r:.<J-A11.,4) te-ll·fHIJ Paw.· G 



Regular Report Form-Continued 

Section 2a- W~re IJIY !JERRIE$ harvuted for u/e fro1111hl$ pla~e Jn 19&9? 

0-Yes :.. Completii this lll'etlon 
Report tenths l (J quart .::: 1 ~ poun s R~p<?rt tenths I 

. 
I . 

of acres of ocres ... 
'ON<>- 290 

:~ 
1 2 

;~ Go to 1. -Strawbe_rries • ·. • • • • ._ • , . . . -. . . • • • • . . . . . . . • . • Pounds 
S•efiOJI 21 · 291 1 2 

2. Raspberries, red .•.••. , •• -.•......••••....• 
~~ Pounds ill' 

292 I 1 2 

'ill' 3. Raspbeirles, blac-k .. ~ .................. ' .. I~ Pounds 

293 

:~ 
1 100·/b. 12 :ill' 4. Cranbeu.les .... " .......... ,. .............. barrels 

S. Other berries - Enter name and No. Jrom list ~elou· 
I 2 

I 

I~ 
: -(a 

l!lame No. Pounrls I --- I 2 

Name No. ;~ Pounds ''io ---
'NIJDI No. fiiiDI No. Namo No. Nama No. 
Jllilckberries and Bluebenjes, wild ...•. 296 Gooseberries ..•. , ... 299 All other berries-

dewberries ........ 294 Boysenberries •••.•.. 297 Loganberries .•..•.•. 300 Write nome above ........ 302 

'3lueherries, tame •.•• 295 Currants ............ 298 Youngberries .•....•. 301 

Fertili2er used 

Acres D•y Liquid or gos 
fertilized l . I 

-E 
I . 

Report f@nths ' -£ Whole I Whole I ~ . c 
of acres . tons I o tons . ... ... ... 

303 304 I 305 

ii· Commercial fer<ilizer used on berries ...•...••.•• iO ·~ ' ~ 

Section 2-1 -)'/ere any VEGETABLES, SWEET CORN, or MELONS harvested for sale from Ibis place in 1969? 
(]nelude crops lituvested fur fresh market, Canni11/1, Jreezblq, or other processing. See Leaflet, section 21.) 

C'Yes - Complete this section Acres harvested I . Acres irfigated I 

iONo-
Ga to 
Soctlan 22 

Report tenths I -£ Report tenths I 
.c . E of acres 

1. Tomatoes 

2. Sweet corn . • •...•.•...•...••.•.•..... : ....•...... 

· 3. Cucumbers and pickles ..••...•.•.•..•.•..•.........•.. 

4, Watermelons ...••...••.•..•••.•••••.•.•.......•.... 

S. Snap beans, bush and pole ..•.•....•••.•..•...•.....•.• 

6. Dry onions ......•••.•..•...••.•.....••••.•........ 

7. Lettuce and romaine ..... ~ ........................... . 

8. Asparagus -...••..•.•.••........•••••.......•...... 

9. Cantaloups, Persians, and muskmelons ..•••..•....•....•... 

·JO·. Sweet peppers, eltcept pimientos •...•••.......•....•.•... 

. 't1. Green peas ...................................... . 

1~. Cabbage . , •..•.......... , •.......•............•.. 

1'3. Squ!\sh , .•...•..•.••.•••..•.••..••.•......•.•.... 

14. Green-lima beans •....••....•....•.••.....•. : . ..... . 

IS., Other vege,table crops - Enter name and No. from list below 

Name ____________________________________ __ 
No. 

Name----------------------------------------- No. 

of acres 

310 

311 

312 

f.m-
314 

[315 

316 

317 

318 

319 

320 

321 

322 

;23 

N.am. · No. 
Attichokes .......... ,. 3u 
Beets ... , ............ aae 

Name No. 
Callllflower ............ 340 

NIJDI No. 
Hot peppers .. .. .. .. • .. 346 

·Bl!ICkeyes-and other 
pen .~.peas •••••• , i36 

13rO'Ceou ................ U7 
Bni.l!llels.sprout& ....... !38 

Celery ................. 341 

ltggplent .............. 342 
&lea( ole, end! ve, 

and-chicory ........... 343 
G9.rlli: ........... , ..... 344 

·carrots .. · ..• ; .... , ; ..... 'su -Honeydew melons •.••••• 345 

·14. Co=~roiai fertilia~~ used on vegetables, 
sweet ¢om, or melonli' .••..•... , •... _, •.•. · •.• 

Page 7 

Kale ................. 347 
Mustard pens • • • • • . . • 348 
Pumpkins .. • .. .. .. • .. • 349 
Radishes .. .. • .. .. .. .. 350 
Shallots and 

pen bnlons .. .. • .. .. 351 

Aerea 
fertili-aed I . 

, R•port tenths I i: 
ol qcre• ~ I . ... 

355 I 1156 

:io 

! . I • ... ... 
I 

'10' ' ill' 
1/1 
i 10 io 
'-{o I ill' 
1/ 

10 

1 

ill' 
:~ 

I 

iO 
I 

'~ ill' 
I 

~~ io 
:~ 

1 I 
I ill' 

:...,-;;I 
' 10 io 
:.-<::: 1 
: 10 40 
: 1 
.~ 'il)" 

~~ 
I 

liD' 
:~ 

I 

,il)" 
i--(o 1 :--:o 

I 
I I 

·~ ·~ 
I 

:10 :~ 

NIJDO No. 
Spinach ................ 352 
Turnips ................ 353 
All other vegetables ...•. 354 

(pimientos, tvrnlp greens, 
ett;.)- Write name o&ove 

Fertilizer used 

Dry Lfq1.1id or gaa . 
Whole I -; Who!., 

~ tons l ton a ... 
I S7 

:10 

. 
1-£ 

~ I . ... 
I 

:~ 

87 
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Regular Report Form-Continued 

Section 22 - Were any NURSERY or GREt;.ftHOUSE PMDUCTS grown lor sale on tilts p)at:t tii 19&Bt (S{le k~i!fla~. s~otton 22.) 

DYes - Complete this sec'tion 

uNo-
Go to 
Section 23 

L Nursery products-:-trees)shfubs, vines, etc.·_ ... ~ ~:• .. ·• ~: 

2.Sod ....••••.•••••.•.•.••..••• ···'• •· •. 

3. Bulbs •.•. , .• , .. : ..... ; ••••.....•••••. • 

Valu'O ~hal_,; 1969. 
Repott ~ppioxlmpte 

-- crmou_nt-
CSNTS NOT RE_QUIRE:D 

1Conh 

4. Cut flowers, floris\ greens, and potted, 
bedding, or other flotist plants , ..•..••••••.. • .. ht.....--------+>-------.--h-...r-------.---

5. Flower seeds, vegetable seeds, and : . . 
vegetable plant$ •.•......••.•.•.•• , •. , • ; .• 17;.,;:--------t.r. 

6. Mushrooms .••.••...•• , ••. • ......••••.•••• 17:.:.-------Y. 

7. Vegetables grown under glass OJ: other protectlo!l: 

a. Tomatoes ••••..•••••••.•.• :. ; ....•.• · .• : 17;.;::;------~~ 

8. Area irrigated -Include item's t through 7 •..•.•.•• ._ _____ _._...._ ____ __;._ 

9. Commercial fertilizer used 
416 

on nursery or gree:n·bouse produets. * •• , •• ~ • , ~ ••• ~ 

Section 23 - Were any OTHER CROPS harvested !tom this place .in l969? (See Leaflet, section 23.) 

C Yes - Complete this seetion 420 

[· . 
1-£ 
l i 

>-
417 

t?ry Liquid -ot gas. . 
1-£ 
I g­

·1" 

:iO 

Wholo 
tOM$' 

418 I 

:-ra 

Acres. irrigated 

1. Root crops for tee:<! •.• • • ·• · · • • • • · • · \ • • • .. • • • · • • • • · • • ·• • • • ' · · .' • 'h4,..2.,1 -------h--------
[JNo-

Go to 2. Sorghums for si.up •••••••••••• , •••••. _ •.•.••••• : • , •.••••••• ; ==-·------+::-------
See lion 24 . 42a .,. 

3. Soybeans hogged .or gtliZ(Id or cut ·for silage ••• , •• : .• .••.•.••.•• · .••••• 1---------r.--------
4. Other crops- Enter name and No. from list.below 

Name 

Name 

Name .No. 
Castor. beans • , ........ '23. 
Cowpeas hogged or 

grazed qr cut 
forsHage ., ......... 424. 

Guar, ............ ; .... 4Q 

Hops ................. 4%6: 

No. 

No. 

.. 44Q' 

' . ' '. ·, * . ' 
5. Commercial fer~ili~er us~d:-qg d!e!le ·,.,~Ps ., . •: . • ,_ .. ,, .o:, ·;. , .'_. .•• ••; .. •• : . .' · · 

Secttan 24- Were any FOREST PRODIJCThold flam lit"' p(Jce·JJJ a&_e?· (See iea,lg~,,secUtm· eil.:J 

C Yes- - Complete thl-. neti'n 

ONo­
Go to 

·t, Standing timber or ttees 

Set:tioll 25 2. F lrewo.od and fue:lwqod 

3. S!!wlop alid venee.t logs •••• , ••• ; ••• 
•,•, -

4.l'ulpwo~d :, •• , ••• •'• ~ ••• , ; .. : ••• .-;' ••• · .. 

s; Ocber fe~rest products (oark; boice, Ght.littti!As ~l'R~; s~'f~r ~it~e:l: . 
11tores, fence posts, illaJ>le ll"od·qcrciJ; e.t~~) '. ·n ; · ••• ;', (; ;· •. ; ·,., •: ·•. 

. I . 
WhoJ~. il :wwote 11 = ton.s • tons· I • >- ... 

ur· I ~42 I 

I/. 
I 101' ;io 

-Volu• of, 14Je! 
Cfrlii'/:S./l/01' ~E'Q.UIRcD 

tConta 



Regular Report Form-Continued 

·,·>· ·:· .:--· . 

Jifl,if~Yili~;j?" .. :~ fjl#~i.e ,his.i~tl!'JiaZ5woJish29willj'<'O:Vid~ ~be inforll)l>,tio!' nee<i.ed forJjvestock,pou!try,and their J?rod­
)~cllW'Ji¢4•f!Y Y.li'l ~ Sol)!eone else, Plea5e iead Uaflf!t, "S.,cnon 25-29," before completmg these secuons. 

;'j;IUfJ{tv.S;or pTHER P-OULTRY on this plac• on DeumtJer 31,1969, 
;rl~e :(etst,1e;t. sei,t.Wn 25.J 

468 

469 410 

; ,?«~~~"~7~.iri:~;t~;l;~t-;4::e -~r~; •. •' .. • • . • .. •. • • ....... • ...... l-4:::7"'1------+4"'7::2c------

.in iidP • it! - S'Pecti!J · 

Sectto.nt~•!-.~1~!~t~f~~~~~~~e.1'TLE or CALVES on this place on December 31, 1969, or /ere any sold from this place in 19697 

0 YeS'- C~fllpl,t• tlif~ ~,;tJOii ND':.~:b~~ 'ti: 1~69" 
. ~:zg:~~;,)..J.:A;.i:~~~i~~~=:u~r~. ~~ .. ~ ............................................. 48 

St!!tliilf/l'!' >:ft.G~'Ws,~ ln¢tude dTJICO'U:sa'/ld lleifers t/latllt}d ca:lved ........................... ITa.--------

.~~~.~. M~l.$~;:"f~ beiler calves (Do not iaclutie Tteifers t/lat lw:d calvectJ • •••••••••••••••••• 
483 

-~ • •• • • • • • a • ~ • • • • o o o o • o • o • o ~ o o • o o L---------

,f~r)4f~k)'tli>ws, -.¢f-~h.e '9tttl cows r<>ported in itelllla, bow many were milk cow~? 
. .. '~;i.!fCW~ 'IJfc'!/mfLlt COW6 ®d fl!ilk lteiJUS that /lad C11}f)ed •• , , •••• , , •••• , ••••••••••••• 

~·~.if~ ~~f":'ho.k l.l>il~ so~d to plants or dealers ·in 1969? .•.•.•..•.•.....•.•..••..•.•. 

'. . ·.· ; 

Total number sold 

486 

Number of miJk cows 
on this plac:e 

D<>combe• 31, 1969 
484 

~48~5---------------

1 DYes 2QNo 

Number fattened on 
grain or concentrates 
30 days or more and 

:cofd fof' slaughter 
(See Leaflet) 

487 

1;4.x;..ule·~ZJ!1ves sold from this place in 1969 -Include those 
:. ,~d 011:,t(l~ !:la.c.e on c_ol'tract or custom basis. 

·J!.•9>J~~'llo14 ...• ; ..•..•........• , •.••..•.......... 'h.;.--------l=:--------
488 489 

ller ~hall cl4ves. ~•>ld , • . . • • • • • • • . , • • . • • . • • • • • . . . • 

•'~ny lt"Sor 'PiGt on lflrs placun December 31,1969, orwere any $old from Ibis place lnl969? 
.).: ,• . 

~~~~-:,d·.·~. '.''' .......... ' ............................. . 
. .. :->-11_.. l;i~~ ~d pi'!s used w to l>e used fo~ breed.in& • • • . • • • • • • • • • . • • • • • • • . . • . . • • • . . . 

sj ~2:~t1jj.~ ~~d pi~ .•• , '· •.• ~ • : ••..••••••••••••••...•••••••.••...•••••. 

-~ Jl•il'i1~«1C~·~owed. ~.tit~ _pla_ee htw~en .,. . 

· .. ·;_{'.·.r.~>t:~;:J~~~.~::·;::3k~: ·::: ~:::::::::::::::::::: ::::: :::::::: 
~ . : _s"-

Total numb•r told 

95 

N~mber oo this place 
December 31, 196-9 

490 

491 

492 

Number of litters 

493 

494 

Number sold oa. feeder 
piga for further feeding 

496 

89 
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Regular Report Form-Continued 

Section 29- Did you or anyone else have any OTHER LIVESTOeK 011 this p.la.ct: on Otcenjber ai,U&$, or W«!l~any_)Oill -f!D~;ihfs place fnl9&9? · 
0 Yes- Complete thl$ section , . . :-.. · -" -N~Ii-.t~:iiu~'p-loce< _., N'uJilber_a_al~:tn ti69 

0No-
Go to 
Section 30 

-__ ·. =o._ • ..,.,~~., 31, .1'9~ _-
- , . - ' - - ' · '-- :SI'II ·' 1511 

1. Hor~es of all ages tDo 710t i11¢l!lcfe ponieS) ••• , •• : • • •. • • -, · • • • : : _.~ • ~ ______ ---+.6,.,1':'3 
____ __,.. ___ _ 

2. Pomesofallases •• ', .•. -•••••••••• •• • • • • • • • · • ·'-· • .-. _.- .• ·-~--------t~-------
3. Mules, burros; an<{ donkeys of all asea -..••.• ~,,. -•.• ; ••• "' .-.; ·' 111-"'. - '615 

~~-----------t~----~~~--
4. Ansora soats •.• :. • ••••.• •. • •.; •-• • ••• • •••••• •. ·;_.-.-.- •• :~16 ·s.t-7 
5. Milk soars •.• , .••••• , -•. .' •••••••• ,'.,: •• ;. , ••• ·,, -•. :,. ,'-.:hs;-:t~e""-------+.:=------.----

. - · . - - ·· · · !Sao--
6. Other &oats • • • • • . • • • • . • • • . • • • • • • . • , • • . • • • , • , • • , , , , , , 

- ' '-~---------+-::-:-----------

7. Hives of bees on this place and honey s~ld .•• ; · • .- • , , . , : ..•.• , • . ------'-+...,--
·res-;,2)!;-----

8. Mink •..•.••••. , .••.••••• , •••••• ,,, ••••••••• , •• · •• ,:· 
h;26~-----------r.-..----~~~--

9- Rabbits .••••••• , •.•.•••••••••. , , , •• · ••• ,, .. , • , • , •• 

10. Chinchillas •••••• , , ••.• , •.••• , • , ••••.• , • , ••• , , , •• , 

11. All other livestock - Specih/ 
630 

530-·' 

Section 30 - Did you have any CONTRACT or BINDING AGREEMENt to produce or market ~y farm products from this ~!lice In 1969? 
(See Leat!et, section 30.) ._. · _ , ' - -· 

'• 0 Yes- Complete this sedlon 
Pra.ductJon 

Marketing 
or sctle.a Motk_. (J.<) ~ many c<>lumn« 

ONo-
Go to 
Section 31 

For each group of products, mark {X) the 
column which best describes the purpose 
of the contract or agreem .. nt .and the -type 
of contractor. If both production and 
markerin& for the product, mark under 
production. Also mark the items furnished 

· eontrac::t "Or· 
agre.,ment 

and repott the amount received. 
540 

1. Poultry and eggs •.• , ... , . : .• , .. _. 
543 

2. Dairy products ....••• , •••••. , • 
546 

3. Cattle ..••••••.•...•.••.•. ~ , 

t 
0 

u 
I .2 

1 2 

f 2 

,1 549 
4. Hogs and other -livestock .• , •.. , ..• 

562 
5, Vesetables - melons, etc .•.••••.•• 

2 

' - 555 
6. Fruits.t citrus, nuts, or berr.ies ..... . 

. sse 
7. Other crops-sugtir beets, peanuts,.-etc. 

8. I' or each product fot which you 
had a conc.rac:t or agreement; 

1 2 

1 2 

1 2 

write the name of the r,oduct 
and indicate whether t e con· Na.ote of {' product 2 ... tract was written, oral, or both. 

1-

~ : • ~ u 

l 6 
3 

3 

3 

3 

3 

s 

.ll 

contract or 
agreernet'l:t .. 

·ad! .. -~.! 
l~ ... 

! ~ 'M :1; 13 
4 5 6 541 1 

4 s 6 s 44 

4 :s 6 I 

4 5 6 5 60 1 

4 s 6 53 ~~ 1 

4 s 6' se 1 

4 s 6 5 1 

l 

J:ur~~~·t;o;h:o::n::::'t:r Am~unt r.ec~ t'ved 

i I-~-
-- from eoritrO:ctor 

i ... . for e~eh prcuf~o~ct 

i - [ g>Jl 
CENTS, NOt RE'QUIRED ~ :g. ·1 "' t .£·~ 

: '-i ol! Dol·fait 1 Cent5 v • .1. w "' U., 0 ,z.: 
2 

' 
4 s 7 542. I 

$ I 

2 3 '4 6 6 7 545 I 

s I 

2 s 4 5 e 7 548' 
$ I 

2 3 4 s e 7 551 I s 
2 3 4 s 6 7 554 I s I 
2 '3 4 -5 6 7 557- I 

s I 

2 ~ 14, s 6 7 560 I 

$ I 
" 

Written Ora-l' Both 

~1. tO 20 sC 
562 tC:: zC aC: 
S.6S 1Q 

Section 31 - MACHINERY and EQUIPMENT on this place on December 3'1, 1969. (Include onlv equimire_nt 
usecf-tn 1968 or 1969. See Leaflet, seetfcm 3t·.J 

Selected machi11ery and equipment on this place, 'December 31,, 1969 "65·ar later '1964 :or eorli•r 
670 571 

1. Automobiles •.. , ..•. , .• , , ••• , , • , •• , ••••• , • .' ••.•• , , .••.•••••• 1-.......-~--,----+.,..,.-------
. ' I~ .~~ 

2. Motortrucks - Include pickups •• _ • , ••••••••••••••••••.•• , ••••••• .- • -1--=::::-~----+=,.-------

3. Wheel tractors ·other than gardeo tractors and motor tiUers .• , , •.• , , • , ••.•.•• 1-:5:::7:::-4-----,--+5:::7;,:5,.--------

4. Crawler tractors , ••. , •.. , , ••. :. , ••• -•• , .• , • , •• _, .•• , , , , •.• , • , .• 'l-:5::7:-t6 '-----...;..+'5::77::' ,.--------
578 579 

5, Riding garden tractors, 7 hp. and over ••.• _._, •• ,, •••••••••. ,, .••• , •. '·'!=,------+=------
- . -$80 581· 

6. Grain and bean combines, sell•ptopeUed only •••••• , .• , : •••••• ; , • : •••• , 1--=:::::---~...,--+=,.--------

7- ·Corn heads for combines ••••••.•.• , , , •• ; • -•••• , , ••• , , , ••• , , •• , .... 1-:sa=a•·--~.;_-ts;;;e;;ac-. -----

8. Other compickers and picker-shellers , , , •••••••.• ~ ••.• , , , _-, •• , , .•.• -;,,,8=11'4---~-+· 5:::8::5,.---------
. ,...586 '511'1 

9. Piekup balets ••.•.••. , • , •••••••••••••.••••.•..••••• , ••••• -•.• '1-o:-:::'::--'7"--'-~+.::::-:::------
,see ses 

10. Windrowers- pull and self·prope-lled (l!:a:clucfe mower concfiUoners) • ••••••• : .-. ·.~-:,,.,.....:..----+=,--------

11. Field forage harv~~ters, sheat bar only •• , , , , • , ....... , •.• , , .... , • '"' •• , L.8..,9.,.0 _,. __ ., __ -~.· 5$_..1 ____ __._ 

12. Estimated market value of all machinery and equipmein usually ke_pt on this place and~.~sed 
for the farm business-lno!ucfe tAe items Usted abov~ IUir:l anv otller -mapfl~11~l1/ 111111l' eqilipment. 

Section 32 - Were any HIRED WORKERS employed to do fiJ.m or ranch work on this place fn 1969? (Do not t'llb!ude 
empl0f166B of lllbOT ccmtractors·who pertormer:l custOlllwork tor 1/IIU. See Leat-!et. sectiott 32.) 

· . CENTS NOT REQUIRED 

6·G 

{ 
a. 150 days or_ -e on chis placlf1 ••••.•• .- • 

b. Less cbao !50 daya on thi~ ~lac:e? , • , , ••• ~6=0=1 ============== 
Pn~C' lO 



Regular Report Form-Continued 

Sectiop 3~ -INSECTICIDES, HERJHCIDES, FUNGICIDES, OTHER PESTICIDES, l.IME and OTHER CHEMICAlS used on this place In 1969. 

Inclu<ie an)' of 
these materials 
paid for by your 
land lord and by 
custoril opetatots. 
For each item 
listed, report 
acres only ollc:e, _ 
but report cost of 
all such materials 
used on the$e 
acres in 1969-
(See Leaflet, 
section p.J 

T.ons 
U$ecl 

Acres on 
which used 

Estimated c:ost 
fDo not include 

<:ost of applyin9) 

CENTS NOT REQUIRED 

Dollors I Cent-s 
~6~1~0~--------+.6~1~1--------~r.6~1°2'--------~----

1, Lime (Do not imrlude land plaster or gypsum or lime for .sanitation.j'-------b;-:;--------~-:-=s _____________ _ 
-~.-Sprays, dusts, fumigants, etc. to coiJ'trol- 613 614 

a. !n~<ects on hay crops· .•..•.•... , •.....•... , .•...••........ - _cc'_s ___________ _ 
1-:6::1-;:5-------- 616 

b. lns¢Cts on other crops (corn, cotton, tobacco, potatoes, trees, vines, etc.) .. r.-:::--------- f-::-:-:s ________ _ 
617 618 

c . ..- Nematodes in crops ......•...... ~ •.............•••.•..... s 
619 620 

d. niseases in crops and orchards (blights, smuts, rusts, etc.) . . . . . . . . . . . . __ .S~-------------ts'21_____ f-G22 

e. Weeds or grass in crops -include both pre-emergence and post-emergence) . .. s 
1';:6::;2:;;3-----·-·-~---------

f. Weeds or brush in pasture • . • . . • . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . -------+=·-'=-· ___________ _ 
1625' 626 

3. Chemicals for defoliation or for gtowth control of crops or thinning of fruit .... 
627 

4-. Expenditures for insect control on li-vestock and poultry .•...................... 

Section 34 "' Production EXPENSES lor !his place ill1969. 

Ind ude your best 
estlm~te of 
expenses paid by . 
others - your 
landlord, .. con­
tractors, buyers, 
ere ...... for ciops, 
livestock or 
livestock products 
produced on this 
place, 
(Se~ Leaflet, 

.sectio71- 34.) 

1. Livestock and poultry purchased -cattle, calves~ hogs, pigs, sheep, 
lambs, goats, horses, baby chicks, poults, started pullets, etc ..... . 

2. Total teed putchased for livestOck and poultry- grain, hay, silage, mixed 
feeds,. concentrates, ecc. (Total of dollars tor a, b, c, and d) . •.••.•....•..•.•........ ~~~~=~ 

I 

a. Commercially mixed formula ,feeds purdased -complete, 
supplement, concentrates. (Do not include ingredients 
purchased separatelu suck as soybean meal. cottonseed 

1Tenths Dollars 

i11eal, and urea. J •••••••••••••••••••••••••••• 

b. Ingredients purchas-ed - such as soybean meal, cotton­
seed meal, urea, etc., millfeeds or -other milling 
by products. (Do not include whole grains.) ••••....•. 

c .. Whole gr~ins purchased - such as corn, oats, barley, 
grain sorghum. wheat, rye, _etc. Include cracked 
grain, (Do not include mill/eeds or other milling 
bpproducts, or green chop.) •.......•.•.......... 

d. Hay, green chop, silage, etc •.••...•..•.......... 

633 

3. Seeds, bulbs, plants, and trees purchased ............•................ 

4. Comlnetclal fertilizer purchased - all forms, including rock phosphate and gypsum ..... 

5. Total gaso~ine and o_thet petroleum fuel and oll purchased for the farm business - Diesel 
fuel, LP gas, -butane, propane, piped gas, kerosene, fu..el oil~ motor- oil, grease, etc. 
(1:otal of a,_ b. c, and di ._ ...•.•.•.......•............•............. 

a. Gasoline 'for the farm business •..•••....••.••...... 

•• LP gas, ·butane, and JS<apane for the farm business ..•.....•...... 1:-:-::-"---------,-------t 

d, Motor oil, grease, piped gas, kerosene, and 
rue1 oil fat the !arm· business •..••.••.•.•..•.......•...... L--'--------'----

: 6, }I~•ed farm 1\'bo_r - Include all -money paid in cash for tarm labor including 
payme11,ts to tatni!v mem.bets, and tor Social Security taJJes. (Do not include 
/10use_W:orlt, customu:ork, and clliltract u·ork.J ....•..•....••..•................•.. 1,-,...-"---------'---

1. :contracUabot· -:-. 111Clude e:sp~ildit!lres primarily tor labor. such as kawesting 
· . . ·ot tru~t.· .vege_tables, 'ber~es, etc" performed on a c011tract basis by a contractor, 
.. _-(l·crew l!la.iier, .a. cooPet!!t)ve, etc. ·• , , • , • . . • • . , , • . • . , · • . • • · • • • . . • · · . . · • . . · · · · . f=ccc·"--------'----

. $.. ¥•chli!e -l!lre. ~nd c\lstom'l\'ork :...1ncl11de e:((Jendttures primarily tor use of equipment. 
· -.iJ.n.d /UT"CU$1t!ilfuo_ork suc/1 as grinding (Uid mixing feed, plowing, combining, corn 

ptcklng, -~Ho filling; $praying, dil;stmg, etc • ••••••••••••••••.•.••....•. 
. . . 

~ • ..\gricq:!tur~l: che'nliq..!s p)lteh<l•ed ..:. Adi dollars. teported i11 section 33 and enter total here 

· :lQ·. ~ ll other production. ~xpenses .- Include current .operati-ng expenses, and depreciation. 
: ·tawes, tnterest, -c<tsl1 rent, insuro:nce·, repairs., etc., tor the farm business. 

(liee Leatltt. ~~~ctton 34.) ...•..•.••••.•.•.......•.•..•....... , ........ . 

' ' . ' 

;tl. Total production expen$es. "-'Add dollar~ tor items 1 through 10 a11d enter total here----+- ~,;_ ___ _ 
811 
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Regular Report Form-Continued 

Sec linn as - MARKET VALUE, before taxes and expanns, of agricultural prQducts '&old frotn tbls -pla-ce in 1~69- ~tops; ·rtvastoek,Jtvestock pro~ilots, .etc, 

Include market 
value of 
landlord's and 
contractor's share. 
rsee Leaflet, 
section 35.) 

1. Grains -com fQr grain, .small grains, soybeans for bean&, grain 
sorghum_•, cowpeas for peas, dry 'beans, and dry peas, • • • • • • • , • • , • • • • • • •". • • • • , • • _, . 

2. Tobacco .... ~ ' .............................. -.... ' .... -~ .... ~ ........ . 
3. Cotton ,and cottonseed .••••....••...•••....• , •••• , ................ , .•.•• 

4. Field sel!'ds, hay, forage, and silage •...•.•.•.....•. ,, ..•••.•.....••..•.•.• , 

5. Other field crops - peanuts, Irish potatoes, sweet· 
potatoes, sugar beets~ sugarcane, ,pineapples, 
popcorn, mint for oil, hops, etc.- Specifll-• .... ·------------------

6. Vegetables, sweet corn. and ,melons (Do .not include Itiah potatoes 
and sweetpotatoes.) ••.•.• , .•••••••••.•••••••••.••••..•.••••••••••.•. 

1. Fruits, nuts, and berr-ies - apples, berries, citrus, grapes, 
peaches, pecanst pears, etc . .... _ ... ~-. .......... , ., • , . ~ ..... _. ·. , ..... , ...... . 

8. Poult;y and poultry products - broilers, other .chickens, eggs, , 
ducks, turkeys; etc, . , .... , .......... , ............. , ... , .................. . 

9. Dairy products -milk, cream, etc. (Report goat iiail'IJ products in item 13.) •.•. , , .••••.• 

10. Dairy cattle and calves .•...... , ..•.•. , • , .• , . , ••......•• , .... , , .•.• , .. , 

11. Other cattle and calves ..•. , .• , ..• , .. , •... , . , •... , •.•••...•••...• , .•. , .• 

12. Hogs, sheep, and goats - Include pigs, lambs, wool, and mohair. 

13. Other lhrestock and livestock products -
horses, mules, -fur-beating animals, bees, 
honey, goat da-iry products, etc. - Speci/v---------------------

14. Nursery and greenhouse produ~ts sold .:. Add dollars reported in sec.tion 22 and enter total here. 

15. Forest products so,ld - Add,dollars reponed ill section, 24 and enter total here. 
16. Total market value of aU agricultural products sold, before tBl<es 

and el<pens¢s - Add dollars Jor items 1 throu{fll11f q.nd enter total here 

,CENTS NOTREQUIRED 

DoUou 1 Cents 
6u 

I 

s I m· I 

$ 
I 

!1&2 I 

s I w· 
I 

$ I 

664 
I 

I s I 

ISss' I 

s 
666 

I 

s I 

~· 
I s 

666 I 

$ 
669 

I 

s 
~- I 

$ 
I 

ls71"" I 

s I 

672 
-1---

I 

I 

s 
673 

I s I 

'674 I 

s I 

'p70 
' $ I 

Section 36 - FARM·RELATED INCOME received in 1969 

Report amount 
received before 
taxes artd 
expenses. 

1: Customwork and other agricultural services provided 'for others -plowing, planting, 
spraying, harvesting, pre,paration of produc.ts for m1>rket, etc. : ••• , ...•• , .. , •... , •• , , 

2. Recre.ational s"rv~ces - providing hu'!riog, fis!ti;n,., picnic.king, camping, 
boardmg and lodging, or other recreat1onal fac1ht1es on th1s place •.•.•••.•.•..• , •. ,, , , 

3. Payments you received for participation in Gove.rnmept fa.rm programs 
!Do not include redeemable loans. See Leaflet, sectic>n ~6.), ••.........•.••••.....• 

. CENTS NOT REQUIRED 
Dollars !Cents 

ao 

s rssr-·-----
$ 

Section 37- Type of ORGANIZATION 
1. Mark (XJ the bo:r u:hicll best describes this operation. 

690 

1 0 Individual or family farm, 
excluding partnership 
and corporation 

2 0 Partnershir., 
including amily 

Section 38- FARM OPERATOR CHARACTERISTICS 

Cotpora,rion, inc ludinjl familY 
(Do not include co·ops, J 

3 C 10 or fewer shareholders 

4 D More than 10 shareholders 

1. Does the operator - the person in charge of the farm or 691 
ranch operations - live on this place? .•.•••.. , , , , .•••.•.••.. , 

G92 
2. Year operator began to operate any part of this place •.•..•.•.• , , .• 

3. Operator's age .•...•....•...••.•..•• , .•..•. ; .... ; . , .. 

s C Other - Specifv 

For -.xa.mple: Estdte or trun, L,.dion 
.reservotlon,prlton farm, gr<izin,g 
oaso-efat1on, e-~·opera,tivo, ett. 

.1 [J Yes 2[JNo 

----Year 

---- Years old 
S94 

2 0 Negro o.r black aD Indian (Amer,) 40 Other 4. Race - Mark IX) the appropriate bo;r.. • • • • ·1 O White 

5. Number of days operator worked off 'this place in 1969 -Include work at a nontarm,iob, bUsiness or · 
profession, or on someone else's farm. (Do not tnclu(je eit;change work.)- Mark (Xi the appropriu.te box. 

695 1 []None 2 0 1-49 days 3D 50-99 dJ!.ys 4 0 100-199 days ·s:D 200 days or more 

Section 39- SIGNATURE of person Ill line this report- Please check vour answers. then sign below. 
700 

Name Dare 

Remarks- Attach separate sheet, if needed. 



-p~~··· 
This fo.m1 ia being WJedin aU parts of me 
United Stalt~<s. Plea,g:e answer me ques· 
tiona di~ appJly tc> your operanons and 
return thia. fprm.ln ·the ~<n.closed envelope. 
P1ea8~< put your ans'w!>rs ln me unshaded 
answe~ · spae~<s. Exp~arions and com• 
llll:'nts omybe written in the llh~tded lilreas 
to the Jolt o( the answer spacu or in· me 
''Rem!).rk$" spac:e on~;(. 
if ym.• do ·not have exact figures, please 
give your best estimate. You may made 
the' Jilnswer "est." ·ctor estimate), if you 
wlsh; 

Po ~· J.nc:lude £taotions in. yoiU' answers 
except J.rl section 4, i~ems l1 th~ 16. 

Fot dolJ;adtems, cents llrl! norrequ.ired. 
If '>' ou pro.!er: to report both dnllllrS and 
cents, . plellse WioJ.te . the C!'OfS in me 
"Cion~" cpJumn. 
(f · titJe II!J•w~r tll an iteln · is ''No" ot 
'i;l.orilt/' ,p~ill\se. ~~'!'e. ~be. ~swer space 
hilll!l<; lllllen · a ma>ll. · llil11wer box ia 
prorldecf;: a,s.·lti .~otlcm :J< X>lease mlltlt 
answe.,s -of, /~.e._,~, ("N'nt"' Ol _<t•N-~neu 

by . :>'!aliilll: ~ .. · ~. ln. me small . :11 ... . 
answet'.bo~. · . ~. 

Short Report Form 

8ud;tt1 Bun~au No. 41 ·568075 
Approval Expir<rs Dec..,&er 1970 

5 

Respon$e to this inquiry is 
required by law (Title 13, U.S. 
Code). By the same law your 
report to the Censll6 Doreau is 
co.nfide-ntial. It may be seen 
only by sworn Census employ­
ees- and may be used only for 
-statistical purposes. 

CENSUS USE ONLY 
801 soz 

803 804 

s.efion 1 -AGRICULTURAL ACTIVITY in 1969 

1. At any time during 1969. did you have or produce any: y •• 

a.·Livestock, poultry, or their products?. • . • • . • . . . O 
b. Corn, sorghums, small gtalns, hay, cotton, tobacco, 

soybeans, peanua;, potatoes, or sugar crops?. • . . . 0 
c. Vegetables, sweet com, melo~f;·or berries for sale? 0 
d. A combined total of 20 or more fruit trees (including 

citrWJ), nut trees, and grapevines?. • • • • • • • . . . . 0 
e. Nursery or greenhouse products or sod? • . . . . . . . D 
f. Any. other crops? •••.•• • • • • • • • • • · • • • • • • • 0 

g. Other agricultural products- horses, fur•bearing 
animals, bees, honey, maple products, naval stores, 
Christmas trees or timber for sale, etc.? .••.•..• D 

Whatproducu? ________________________ __ 

2. At apy time lo 1969, did you own any land that was 

No 

0 

D 
0 

0 
0 

0 

0 

used by someone else for •gricultur:al purposes? . • • . 0 D 

. . If you on~wereJ "No" to ALL of the questions above, 
pins.• •kip to page 4, complete section 13, onJ return tlti s form. 

Acres 

t •. i.'tlnl:l.~<.t~·h·.-;;:.;·_. ; .••..•..••..• , •••••••.....•.•. ·. · • · · · • · • · · · 
t; ta~tien.~'d or least4 fr'oi11 ·nlh~ .:.. ·c~ltlde llmd worked on shares or share­

None 810 
0 

.crOJlP~ti.~~<~tb;ets:.le4seit F,~. 8~. alidr(lltro-att land; amt !ami used rent 
···/Me. (D& '/IQt. i11~11de 'lllmi used on'·.fl fler-ltead llll$18 7mder a urazina permit.) • ••• 

3i L$~d:te~d:"li~~c!.~:odl~ -·l~e·!Ond .subleased ami !ami worked 
,,ll118flar~~T: ~!~-;ttill1Pi!d w.·otlleJ\t,. • ~ ••••••••••••••••••••••••••• 

~· 

..•. ~l,~~:r~~~~~~~~~~~~=. u::::t::~~~k. ~r•o•t~e~ • • 
. ~~·Jle~• •Hipte l!.llf,Mal.{;~'lbii~Wlf~ d~~c!.~:t~f itrust, or !e;nd purchase 

:~lil-~.ea,oo 4:l)}l ~~ >$1'hll.~~dl~d~uil!linp yo:u oVIo? ••••••••.••• 
' :-~., ' • "' • • • ':: ·"· \':<,· ' • .,. ,.. • ' • :, 

None 

0 

None 

0 

811 
None 

0 
None 812 

0 

815 

Acres 

816 
10 Yes 20No 

817 

Persons 

None a1e 

------- Acres 

that land in 1969 or if -tb';;~;.~;­
teltson, please skip to page 4, 

.the county shown· Jn me upper tight comer of the addtess label? 

813 
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Short Report Form-Continued 

Section 4 -CROPS harveued for any purpos.e from tlfi~· p~ace ·In· 196? ,.. .Report all Ql'OPS harvested. lnclucle crops 
grown under contract. Be sure to include ,la'mtlora~.s share .. · 

1. Field corn for grain - Report qWJnttty on a she Ued basis anlt. 
in one unit onl!l- either buslrels or huiHiredwillgkt 

2. Field corn for .silage, cur for green or dry fodder, hogged •or 
grazed (Do not· include acres. already reported in item t) • , , 

3. SQrghums for grain. or seed - Report q.uantity harvested in 
one unit only- either bushels or pounds •••••• , . · •.•••.• 

4. S~>rghums for silage, cut for <)ry forage or hay, o;. hogged or 
grazed (Do not include here acres alreacl!l reported in.it~m'3 

~.....,_,---'-~-I~~ 

.. ·.~~---------Y/.~~za 

5. Wheat for grain ••..•.• , •.••.•.. , • , ••.••.• ~ .• ,. 

6. Other small grains for grain-oats, barley, ·rye, rice, etc;.~. 

7. Soybeans for beans ••• ·, .. , •••.••••.• , • • •.• ; .• , . , • 

8. Hay- all kinds except sorghum hay !lf two. or more 
were made from the same land, R-EPORT ACRES· ONLY 
but report total tons of all cuttings.! •••. , ••• ,'. · •••••• 

9. Cotton , .••• , •.• , .•.• , •.•••••••• : • ..•••. .' , •••• 

834 

836 

Bvshels 

Tons, 
dry 

Bale~ 
+---------~~~----~----

838 

10. Peanuts for nuts ••.•••• , ..•••••.••. , •. • • '." .••••. 

NOTE: For items 11 through 1,6, r~port whole 11er~s tm<l t•pihJ 

11. Tobacco-all types .••• • ...••.•••• , ••.• •.•,•., ••• 
~---------+~~~ 

1 5. Land in bearin'g and non bearing ftuit 
groves, vineyards, 11nd nut trees of all 
whick the fruit crop tailed. (Do 1Wt 

16. All other crops-Include field seeds, sugar crops, (J<irrien, 
nursery and greenhouse products, sod, etc • • i • . ; . ; ,_, ; ••. 

17. If any greenhouse products were sold, hoiV maiJ.y. ~qu~e. . , ,M6 
feet were under glass or o.ther protection? •. ·, • •• ,,; ••• , • ,' • .••. :, •• , •••.•• : 

Section 5 - Land USE In 1969.: The purpose of tlJ.ts secU~ is. to di$tr~ll!!te ali acres tn this place · 
amona items 1 through 5. - · ' 

' ' 

1. Cropland harvested - fnclude a~l la~cl from w'M,ck ~ro:ps .1Jie.re ~a_rv~lit~d or hart 
was cut, and all land ~n orphards, c~trus groves •. mneyarets; (lnif nur~;erv and 
greenhouse products. {lf two crops were l!arvested trom the sftme !~uid 'in t 96~. 
report tile acres onlv once.) •• • •••• • • • • ;·, • • •·• • • .' ·-•·~···· ·.·~ • •' • • • • • • 

2. Cropland used only for pa~tnre or grazing •.• ~ •••.• , • • .• ,. • ,- • .• ,. • • · •. • , • 

3. All other croplapd-biclude cropland usetf,Jor son-impr~uerr:ent'c~op~, crop 
failure, cultivated summer tallow, and idle or.oplaJic{ • ••• ·, · .••• • •• ,. ~ ••••• • • • 

4. Woodland -Include woodland pasfll1re • ••••.•• .,, • · •• h• • • • , • • · •• •· • •• ,. • • 

5. All other land - lnc lucie pasture land ot/t:er tllan cro:plan4 .411d .wood!a11d pastUre, 
rangeland, and land in house lots, barn lots. ponds, roads', 1lia$telilna, etc • •.•••• 

6. Total acres in this place -·Please add the acres repo;t~d 1/11, ttelfrls t 
. through 5 a,nd enter. tile to'ta! 'WI t/ltl;s space _...__......, 

(This total should be the same as the total m section 2, ite!!l 4..! 

eeQ 

$61 

862 

863 

''864 

'86$ 

866 

P~und$ 

$quare. 
feet 

Ac;«~ 

Acres 

A<:ru 

Acres: 

Ac~u 

Tat<>l 
ae:~s 

AcrM 7. How much of the coral land repcmed in ,item 6 was irrigated in 1969?. , .• , •• • • • L-------..:;:~=.,. 

Page 2 



Short Report Form-Continued 

Sec:tlvn ~ .- UVE$TQCK iJnii>POityTaY -. :See s~Ke: t6 -rcipo.it allliv•rsxock <~nd poultry on thill place on 
, - , ,.- Oefemh<it3l ~ i9~9, no.·m,itter ~li..:-1[w:lftrd them; - IMIAute as, sold allltvestock and 1/0UUrv 

-· · ferl •. oft ii c.ontrac£ l)r "Cit8/9111 1l¢ff~,4lfl4 ~en)rom tMs place zn 1:969. 
, · - , - '/ ·' ' - Number on 

Dee•mber 
'/ . 

- .. 
l. Carcie and calve,$-.. ()£ Jill; ~e~·;i <• 

o,Caws,;,.fnt:l~dn1¢t,>wstifU!I!etterff'liftatlu:ulcaWed.' •••••• 1=:,...-------;; 
, (1) Q£ the t<!cal~~>W.s ~on~ m- i~m ia, how/ i!;a:ny we•e 

'kept for iltllk production? -:fnt41!4e drf/l mitk cows and 
milk heite~&;tTtdt.had calved;.,.; • , ••.•••••••••••.•. 1:-::-------~~ 

. 2. Hog~ imd)igaot.aii:aees • ,;: . ; .•• ~ ~ .• · · · · · • • · · · • · · · !?h~:m::~?'0~~t.;;;;----­
"· Of, the ci>ta:f sc!idib~w jllallf .were soLhs fl!eder pigs for 

further feedUJ# :/: .. : •. , . ; •:. ~·· •.•••.•.. · ·. · ...... • 

3. Sheep and lambs o{all age~ :. ••.••..••..•. • ....•.•... 1--------f--------

4. Horses and ponie.s .of ,a11 age~ .• , • ; •..••••.• • •• · ••••. · 
~--------~~---------

5. Hens and pulLets of )ayjng age {E:&clude started pullets being 
rais(ld {or sale;) :• ; .• •••• · •••.•• • •••••••••••••••••••• 1----------ir--------

6. Any ·other chi~kemr 3 months old or older (roosters, capons, 
started p\!llets) • ,, .•• , ••••.•••.••••..•••........• 1---------+--------

.. Number of litters 
9. Litters of pigs farrowed on this place between -

a. December I, 1968, and May 31, 1969 •.•••.•.••.•...•.......•.•...•.. 
889 

890 

b. June 1, 1969, and November 30., 1969 •.••.•.•.••...•........•......•• 

Section 7 - Production EXPEMSES for this plaee in 1969 - Repon expenses paid by you and by others - your 
landlord, contractors, buyers, etc.-for crops, livestock, or livestock products produced on this 
place. Use estimates if exact•figures are not available. 

CENTS NOT REQUIRED 

1. Livestock and pollltry purchased- cattle, calves, bogs, pigs, sheep, 
lambs, goats, horses, baby chicks, poults, started pullets, etc. . ...•.....•.•. 

~~--------4----
2. Total feed purchased for livestock and poultry- grain, bay, silage, 

mixed feeds,, concenuates, et.c. ' ............. , .... ~ ................ , .. 

a. Commercial mixed formula feeds 
purchased- complete, supplement, 
concentrates (Do not znc!ude 
ingredients purchased separately, 
suck as sou bea·n mea!, cottonseect 
meat and urea.) •• ' ••••••••••••.•.• '------=-----'---f~:"' 

Page 3 
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Short Report Form-Continued 

2. CroP". inchJd~lt8·11UfJI~~ l?to:4ul1\t$.anil b!!y. sold .. 
3. Foie$~ produees,...fk~w9ndr b,t~l"#.ood, ff!lc<U>~~~~ . 

gum fo.r na'l!•l sto~, s.rlpdfn$ t~ber·or.tmes, m 
4. Total •ket,v:al~ lilf a# ~yt<=uleuraJ; p~odue, . 

expe.ases- A: fl{tf,~i'$ :f!>t it~ms t t/lt.OOff/t. 8· · ~t!lr 

S:ction 9 - FA~~~TEDll~CQMii r~oivoil!i f9'69 ~ ~~~rt.a:mii-~c;i~~A ~~~it~t@lrs,antl e~p~nses.. . 
. · . ·. :' i , ... : . .: :<;" . . : : · C< •. : ~T~ NOt REQUIRE() 

l. CustoU:worl< and 0ther iltrlou~~lalsery~ces pt~';idel!\ (o~ ~~x~~ ~Io>/flni• · .9lO 
0~ ll••• 

1 
C•nts 

planting, llptaying•·ha'rvelltirig,·Prepouation e~;f,t>io.dllc.ts ·tor~~~~ e:~J<;~ . ;'. < .b---·--'s'--------:---
2. Recrea$io.na1 ~et'?i~t~41'-Pr~idoag hul!cing, tisl:jinJii'·!li~nick,i~$;:~abi,Ping, .·· .· tar 

boarding and l~>dg:ingi 11>r other recreath>nal £acdl~tiecs on tl)il~p~~e .n.:; • ~·. 
3. Payments you received for participatioh·in g(>vemment':hlim:pu..~)li'll . :\ell} 

(Do not inclwe re!l~eilll1•b!e loans.) •••••••••••••••. , •• :. ,• ::• ., •.:~ ·, ·•• , • ..' '·''·. ·,,.; ,,; .. .,: ·,. 

Section 10 - MACMIN&RY a~cl EQUIPMENT on this p\i!ce OJ\' b'!!ct:nlbe; ll, l969~ ~b~i\'i;.t :O.~~d by- yo~ or by 
others•lnclflde 0!1&11 equipment U8edin :19~8 ort~ll'9: ., , • . ·, .. , · fi9Qib~t mO,h.ufO'ctu•~d In '7 

Selected machinety and equipment .on this place D4cmbe: 31 ,J~SI: · · .:l96S oF,l<iter.l, 1464 ·or nrJI•• ., ~"0 . '", 
1. Automobiles , , •••• •· •.•.•••• : ••. ·., • · ••..•.• ·,. ,., • • :·; ., <. ,,,", .• , . 1----:---·-----f-,..------

, . ' . . :,9112' 943' 

2. Motorttuck& -Include pickwps •••• ·• •• ·.' •• ·• ; •••••••• , ~ ,, • ·, ~·, • ·~ ·, :. , 
. ' . . 944 

3. Tractors other than aarden tractors ll!Id•mQtQr t.rlte~ ••••• : .·, .: ••• · •• • .•• 1------J-.....C.---- I 
!l46 ,947 

4(. Riding gar<;jen tractors 7 hp. am;! oyer , ••.• , , '; .' ', , , •• , • , •. • • ·, • , ., · •. , •. , 

S. Grain and bean combines- self·pcopeUed only · •• , • ' .•.•.• :~ .• • .• .' • :" .• 
9~0 

6. COtnpicl<ers and picker•shellers, Jncl~dinl! corn heads> for comblne$, ••• , •• , 

7. Pickup balers ................................ • :·•,.. •.i • •. ; •• ,, 

8. Estimated ma~k"t valt~e of aU macd:Unery an.d· equipment usu~tly .kept· on . 
this place and used for th.e farm busine&s ..; 1nc Vuae tlt.e items. Lis(ed. above 
an!l antl other irlachiMrlJ a:nd eq14ipment • ~ •. : •• ~ • • •• •.• ••• , ' .•• , ••• ·.:• ~:· .• . 

Section 1l - VALUE of l11nd and llUlLOINGS on thi.s· plo~• 

1. Please enter your estimate of tile cwrent ·market' value·:o.f . 
the acres you operatecl.(owned and .tent~d actes ln ·sec.tion 2, 
item 4) and the bt~i!c:llnas on diem • : ·• • . • ; :: , , . ·' : • .• • .: •. • • , • • • • • • ·· • 

Section 12 - FARM OPERAT.OR CMARACT~RISTIC$ 
1. Does the operator- the person .in cha••ge olthe farm 9'70 

or ranch operations- live on this place? , •• ·• : .••.••• , ..... , .• • . • 1 0 Yes 
. . ' 97\ 

953 

CENTS NOT REQUIRED 
P ollars ' C•nl• 

954 

CENTS NOT Rll'QUI'RED 
Dollors I Cont• 

20 No 

2. Year· operator beg~n to operate any pare of this place • , .•••••••••• _____ Year·· 

• . 97.0! 
3. Operator's age •••.• , ••. , . , ..••.••• : •.• ·, , ·, .•••• , ••• , • ~~---Years old 

973 

4. Race - Mark (X) tlt.e appropriate bor 1 [l White 2 0 Ne&ro ar blaell; 3 0 lildian (Am~:} .. ~ 0 Other 

S. Number of days operator worked oft this place in 191$9 -lncliude wor7ozt a.nonfarm to/1, l»lsi'll~ss or.prqt:es:sion, 
or on someone else's Jarm. !Do not include etJJch:arHI.e·work;) MCC!rk (X) the appropriate /Joj;. " · 

974 f [l None 2 [] 1-49 days 3 0 .50'-99, ~ys 4 0 lQ0-199 days 1 [J 2·QO dt\ys or ntl>re 

Section 13- SIGHATUR,E of·person filling tliis i•part- P.lease checkuoui 
answers, tlt.en sign be lou•. B1& 

Name Date. 

Remarks - Attac/1 separate sheet, if needed. 
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Leaflet Guide 

;~r,,~~Mr~ 
·~(i]··~~~ : ffi~" ~ \ '!! 
~••r...,.,O'..~ 

Janua!'Y 1970 

\ 

U.S. DEPARTMENT Df coMMERCE 
Bureau of tbe census 
washlnQton. 0 c 20233 

Dear Sir: " ,, d•• '" '"' "'" '"~' "' "'"'"~' ~' ,_ "" '" """""~ thiS vi tal record of America's rarrr.s and rancheS is ve!'Y much needed. 

'"''~"' <~'"'' oO ._.;oo< W<'' <oW• ,.,coOCoo>'s oCoOO ""'' '""' <"'"'"' ' own•<~ <'o< o< ,uU-'"" e<N•-'"'• h<N"'~" ""'"" 
o;; ,:uverrJ:cer>t, cc>z~r.ess, and eaucatic.·n· 

"" w• "" • • "''"'" , o c"' '" ; o "•"' "'"' """' """' '"' "" '"'"' 

of verY special importance. '~'' ""''" ·~ ~""' "'"'' ,, -"' ,, ,.~ ~"'""' '''"'"'" ' '~""''"' "" ·~ o<=' """''""' ""' '" '" _,_., '' ''~' "'' 
""'''" . ""' 0~<'' ""' '"'"' oo offl~'~ '"""'' ~ <•~ "'''" • oo•· •·'~ ,n "" '"' <•~ ~· '""''"" "'' .... ~" '' '"''' =' H«•=' "" ""' ,_ MC<>''"' '"' """'" "' , W <M obMC"' oC Cd'"'' ,,,.,_ ''" 

bOth farm and nonfarm people. 

""' '""""' ""' '" , ... ,~· -' " """'"' '""' " "' '""' '""""'' '''"" are to prosper· Decisions that will lead to improved programs and more 

"'"'''"" .,.,,,, ~" " '""' 00 "'"''" ,.... '''" , .. ~ "'' """"-

....... 

.... c, o ,·.n '" """"""'"' w•'"'"'-'"' ""' ''"'' ,n """' '"' "''' o< _,,,. '.,u-"' ,,,,,. o< ,n ''"'' ,,, ,.,,,,u "• '"' "" '''" 
of ob',ainir.g w up-to-date an<l accurate :nvento!'Y of our agricuHuNl 

rescurces. """ om w< '" ,,,;wo ,,.,. oo< ~c< H '"'' w "' " ""' "' '"" cw, 

,.. '""""' "·'' '. '"' """ '' '~ ,., "~ . ",.. '"' '"""''' ,,., "'" •""' 
requires no postage. 
'"'" ~··~• .en u "'" ;o. ""''"" ,,cw•·"'· n ,., "' "'" "'·" ~ 
''"'"' ""'' "''" "' '"' ~ "" "'"' '"" ""'" ''".' "'""'"' . "'" '"' (" '" u, " .o. '"'") '"'"'"" w• " ,_,, >• ••- w "" ,,; "' owM 

L 

oucside the sureau for any purpose wnatsoever. 

]'cur hel;:; in ccmpletir.g this irr,portant census is mos-t aprreciated. 

Sinct:relY, 

,~-~;· 
(jq,..ll"l.. J~/_.r-

J- Thomas Breen, Chief 
Agriculture Div~sion """ ", ........... ,, ......... , ... '"' , .... ·····-........ , ... . 

THIS IS YOUR LEAFLET GUIDE 
Through the 1969 Census of Agriculture 

Need Help? Use These Leaflet Notes 

1 

-

Leaflet Introduction 

FIRST, SOME GENERAL INFORMATION 

e The enclosed Census report form is being used by farms and ranches throughout the 
entire United States. Because it is meant for use in all parts of the country, it may 
contain sections and inquiries which do not apply to you. Where this is the case, you 
can simply mark the "No" box and go on to the next section. 

• If a section contains inquiries that apply to you, it may be helpful to read all the 
items in the section before you start to supply the information. A look at the 
section as a whole will show what is to be reported and where it should be written. 

• You will also find that there are items within sections you may not need to read, 
beyond noting the subject with which they deal. For instance, item 9 in section 1 
asks several questions about landlords. If you did not rent any land from others, you 
can skip all of the detail in item 9 and go to item 10. 

• There is a possibility that you may receive more than one envelope containing a 
census report form for this place {a duplicate, or in your wife's name, your partner's 
name, etc.). If this should happen, please fill out one form only. Mark the extra 
form or forms with the Census File Number of the form you complete {for example, 

"Extra-See No. 86312 09812") and return the extras in the envelope with the 
completed report. There is a "File Copy" enclosed in each envelope; this is for your 
use and should not be returned to the Bureau of the Census. 

If your wife, or a partner, runs a separate agriculture operation of her or his own, it 
should be reported on a separate form. 

HOW TO MARK YOUR ANSWERS 

• Please put your answers only in the unshaded answer spacas. Write any explanations 
and comments in the shaded areas to the left of the answer spaces or in the 
"Remarks" space on page 12 or on a separate sheet. 

• If your answer to an item is "No" or "None," please leave the answer spaces blank; 
except for the few places where a small answer box is provided, as for "None" in 
section 1. Please mark an answer of "Yes," "No," or "None" with an X in the box. 

• If you do not have exact figures available, please report your best estimate. You may 
mark the answer "est." {for "estimated") if you wish. 

• For all dollar items, we need only whole dollars, although a "cents" column is 
provided for those who wish to use it. If you prefer to report both dollars and cents, 
be sure to write the cents in the "cents" ·column to avoid the risk that they be 
mistaken for dollars. For example $1714.45 should be reported as 

CENTS HOT lf£01JIIf£0 

or as o.n .. , •c ...... 

•u I /7/¥·: '15 
but not as 

- 3-

lc£NTS foiOT ~fOUIR£0 
I o.11••• •c ...... 

r ,1711/.1/S', 

CENTS NOT lffOUIR£0 
Oollo•o ,c.,.,. 

" • 17/'f: 
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Do not include fractions in your answers except where called for. Where fractions 
are called for, report the fraction in tenths of the whole number, and enter the 
fraction in the "tenths" part of the answer space. Some common fractions which 
you can report in "tenths" are: 

Report 1/8 as 1/10 
1/6 as 2/10 
1/4 as 2/10 
1/3 as 3/10 

3/8 as 4/10 
5/6 as 8/10 
3/4 as 8/10 
2/3 as 7/10 

Example for 3% tons of tertii izer 

5/8 as 6/10 

If you prefer, report to the nearest whole number; fractions are not required. 

• HOW TO USE THIS LEAFLET 

This leaflet is for your use; do not return it with your Census of Agriculture report. 
It gives answers to the questions that come up most often when the report is being 
prepared. 

Like the form, this leaflet is being used in all parts of the United States, and it 
contains much information that will not apply to your place. For example, section 4 
of this leaflet gives additional information about reporting irrigation water in section 
4 of the report. If you did not irrigate in 1969, you should answer the first two 
questions and you'll not need to read the corresponding page of this leaflet. 

The rest of this leaflet is information to help you, organized by sections to 
correspond with the sections of the census report form. 

Now you will want to start filling out the report form. As you answer the items in 
each section, you will find substantial help in the corresponding section of this 
leaflet. 

SECTION 1 ACREAGE IN 1969, OWNERSHIP, AND LAND VALUE 

Part A Use items 1, 2, and 3 to arrive at the acres of land for which you should complete 
the Census report form. Include all agricultural land with which you were associated 
in 1969, regardless of where the land was located. Do not include holdings of 
residential or commercial properties not associated with agricultural operations. 
Report all land in whole acres; if you had less than one acre report it as one acre. 

Places no longer operated on December 31, 1969- If you had agricultural operations 
at any time during 1969, complete the report, giving information on the land you 
operated and your 1969 crop and livestock production and sales from that land. 
Normally you would not be expected to report inventories of poultry, livestock, 
machinery, or equipment. Please explain in the "Remarks" section on page 12 or on 
a separate sheet that you quit farming or ranching during 1969 and give the 
approximate date. 

Other changes in land operated during 1969 - If part of the land you used during 
1969 was no longer in your possession on December 31, 1969, include that land and 
your 1969 crop and livestock operations on that land in your report. If you acquired 
land during 1969 for your own use but did not use it for crops or livestock that 
year, do not include that land in your report. 

-4-

Item 1 

ltem2 

Item 3 

Item 4 

Please explain the change in acres during 1969 by making a notation in the 
"Remarks" section on page 12, or on a separate sheet. Statements such as the 
following can be used: 

My report includes_ _________ acres I used in 1969 but which I did not 

have on December 31, 1969. 

or 

My report does not include __________ acres acquired before January 1, 

1970, but not used by me in 1969. 

Land owned - Include all land associated with agricultural operations in 1969, 
whether held under title, purchase contract or mortgage, homestead law, or as heir 
or trustee of an undivided estate by you and/or your spouse, or by the partnerships 
or organizations for which you are reporting. This acreage is considered in figuring 
the size of "This Place" (item 4, section 1). 

Land rented or leased from others - If you rented land from others or worked land 
on a share basis in 1969, you should report this land as rented by you even though 
the landlord may have supplied equipment, fertilizer or other materials, and some 
supervision of your work. Include Federal lands rented or leased by the acre in this 
item, but not land used on a per-head or animal-unit basis (see "Grazing permit" on 
page 6). 

Land rented or leased to others 

Include in item 3: 

• Owned land rented to others for cash or a share of the crops or livestock. 
• Land which you rented from others and then subleased to others in 1969. 
• Land rented out for residential or other nonfarm purposes (if it was included 

in item 1 or 2). 
• Land worked for you by someone else on a share-of-the-crop basis. 

Do not include in item 3: 

• Land on which you yourself had any crops or livestock during 1969, even 
though it was rented to others for part of the year. 

In the remaining sections of the questionnaire, do not report any crops or livestock 
on land reported in item 3 as rented or leased to others. 

Acres in this place- This is the sum of the land you owned in 1969 plus the land you 
rented from others, minus the land you rented to others. It is very important that 
you report this figure correctly since the remainder of the form applies only to the 
resulting net figure- the "Acres in this place." That is, your report should cover only 
the operations on "Acres in this place," as reported in item 4. 
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Item 10 Grazing permit · In some States, government lands are used for grazing livestock 
under permit or special license, payment being made on a per-head or animal-unit 
basis. This land should not be included as part of item 2, "Land rented or leased," or 
item 4, "Acres in this place." Report it only in item 10. But if any of your livestock 
were located on such land in 1969, they should be included in your report. 

SECTION 1 SHOULD YOU COMPLETE THE REST OF THIS FORM? 

PART C YES, if at any time during 1969 there were on this place: 

• Any livestock or poultry or their products. 
• Any corn, sorghums, small grains, hay, cotton, tobacco, soybeans, peanuts, 

potatoes, or sugar crops. 
• Any vegetables, melons, or berries grown for sale. 
• A combined total of 20 or more fruit trees (including citrus), nut trees, and 

grapevines. 
• Any nursery or greenhouse products, mushrooms, or sod. 
• Any other crops. 
• Any other agricultural products · horses, fur-bearing animals in captivity, 

bees, honey, maple products, naval stores, Christmas trees or timber for 
sale, etc. 

NO, if· 

• You reported an acreage in section 1, item 4, but had no agricultural 
operations in 1969, on that land, or 

• All your land was operated by a renter or sharecropper and hence the entry 
in section 1, item 4 is "o.·· 

In either case, you should: 

1. Skip to page 12 and complete section 39. 
2. Explain briefly in the "Remarks" space. For example, "All land rented 

out;" "Sold farm in 1968;" "House lot only-no crops or livestock." 
3. Mail the form in the return envelope provided. 

SECTION 2 For item 2 of this section we need the name of the geographic area or political 
subdivision (within the county or parish) where your principal agricultural 
operations are located. Some examples of the type of area or subdivision we mean 
are shown on the report form; some other term may be used in your State such as: 

Borough 
City 
Civil district 
Civil township 
Election precinct 
Grant 
Indian reservation 
Judicial township 
Justice precinct 
Location 
Magisterial district 
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Militia district 
National park 
Patent 
Plantation 
Purchase 
School district 
Surplus 
Town 
Tract 
Unorganized township 

SECTION 
3 

Item 1a 

Item 1b 

Item 1d 

Item 1e 

LAND USE IN 1969 

These land-use items apply only to the land you reported as "Acres in this place" in 
section 1, item 4. If part of your land was used for more than one purpose in 1969, 
report such land only on the line for the first item which fits one of the purposes, 
and not on the line for the second purpose. For example. if you harvested a grain 
crop and later let cattle graze on the stubble, report the land as harvested cropland, 
but not as cropland used only for pasture or grazing. Please report in whole acres. 

Cropland harvested ·This includes acreage from which you cut either wild or tame 
hay, land in greenhouses, nurseries, or sod, and land in orchards, groves, and 
vineyards (both bearing and nonbearing) unless the trees or plantings have been 
abandoned. 

Pastureland · Cropland from which you did not take a crop or cut hay in 1969, but 
which you used for pasture is to be reported in item lb. Woodland in which 
livestock were allowed to graze in 1969 is to be reported as woodland pastured in 
item 2a. 

Report in item 3 land (other than cropland or woodland) that could be used as 
pastureland or rangeland, whether or not livestock actually grazed on it in 1969. 

Crop failure · If all of a crop failed (except fruit or nuts in an orchard, grove, or 
vineyard being maintained for production) and you did not harvest any other crop 
from this land, and did not pasture or graze it, report the acres in item 1 d "crop 
failure." If only part of the acreage of a crop was harvested, be sure to report only 
the harvested acreage in item 1 a of section 3 and for the appropriate crop in sections 
8 through 23. 

Cultivated summer fallow · Report as fallow all cropland that was plowed and 
cultivated or on which the growth of weeds was controlled through the use of 
herbicides, but which was left unseeded for 1969 harvest for the purpose of 
conserving moisture. Include such cropland as cultivated summer fallow even if 
during.1969 it was planted to wheat for harvest in 1970. 

SECTION 4 IRRIGATION 

Item 4 Source of water in 1969 · Most irrigators will have received water from only one 
source. If this is true in your case, enter 100 percent on the proper line. If you 
obtained water from two of the three sources, an approximate figure for each source 
is acceptable, for example, 30 percent, 70 percent. etc. One way of making such an 
estimate is to figure your acreage irrigated from each source as a percent. For 

exsmple, 20% of the cropland harvested irrigated from your own well; 80% of the 
cropland harvested irrigated with water from a water supply organization. 

Item 5 Estimated quantity of water used in 1969 ·If you can estimate the total quantity of 
irrigation·water used by any one of the methods shown, report only by that method 
· in item a, b, or c. If it is easier for you to estimate part of the water used by one 
method and part by another, use the lin~s which apply. 

Acre-feet· Many irrigation districts measure water in acre·feet and the amount used 
is shown in acre-feet on their bills. Where you are not billed for water in this 
manner, you may prefer to give the depth applied in inches during the full season 
and the acres covered, as called for in item 5c. We will compute the acre-feet from 
this information. (Item 5 discussion continued on next page.) 
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Gallons - Estimates in gallons must usually be figured if you have your own pump. If 
you know the rate of flow through your pump, use that. Otherwise, use the 
manufacture<'s rated capacity for the pump. This is given in gallons per minute. 

To make an estimate of gallons for the season, you can substitute in the following 
example, the rated capacity of your pump, the approximate number of hours you 
pumped per day, and the estimated number of days the pump operated during the 
year. 

EXAMPLE 
Step 1. Compute gallons per hour - 100 gallons per minute times 60= 

6,000 gallons per hour 
Step 2. Compute gallons per day· 20 hours pumped times 6,000= 

120,000 gallons per day 
Step 3. Compute gallons per season · 96 days pump operated times 120,000= 

11,520,000 gallons per year 
Step 4. Enter 11,520,000 for item 5b. 

When a sprinkler system is used, it may be simpler to estimate depth of water 
applied during the season in inches and report acres covered. 

Other methods of reporting total quantity - In some areas miners inches are used to 
measure water use. In other areas cubic feet per second (second feet) are a common 
measure of flow. If you use either of these measures, please report this information 
in the "Remarks" section at the end of the form, or on a separate sheet, rather than 
in item 5. If you report in either miners inches or cubic feet per second, please don't 
forget to report also how many hours or days water was delivered at the given rate. 

If you are not able to report the actual amount or an estimate of the water quantity, 
please give as many facts as you can in the "Remarks" section (page 12) or on an 
attached sheet of paper. Following are examples of helpful items: number of wells, 
their depth, diameter and measured rate of flow; allowable diversion rate from 
streams; capacity of pump or diameter of pump outlet; days operated per season or 
number of times irrigated; whether land is irrigated before planting; and so on. 

SECTION 5 ARTIFICIAL DRAINAGE 

SECTIONS 
8--23 

Acreages reported in this section should be your estimate of the amount of land on 
this place in 1969 which was benefited to some extent by artificial drainage 
facilities. Even though your whole place may be in a drainage district, report only 
that part which is artificially drained. Acres drained by more than one system should 
be reported only once, for the most important one. However, if different parts of 
this place had different types of drainage systems, you will have entries in more than 
one item. 

CROPS HARVESTED IN 1969-GENERAL INFORMATION 

How and where to report - You will find it easier to report your crops if you glance 
through pages 3 to 8 of the reporting form and read the paragraphs on pages 9 to 11 
of this leaflet, before you begin to fill in your answers. 
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Report in each section only the crops called for there. For example, field corn is to 
be reported in section 8, wheat in section 10, Irish potatoes in section 13, and 
vegetables for sale in section 21. Section 23 is the place to report any crop not asked 
for in sections 8-22. 

Do not include in your report any crops on land that in 1969 was rented or leased to 
others or worked on shares by others. Your report should cover only the crops on 
the "acres in this place," as reported in item 4 of section 1. The next 6 pages of this 
leaflet contain general information about the reporting of crops, and a discussion of 
some special crop reporting problems. Table 1, at the end of this leaflet provides a 
listing of conversion factors for the crops most commonly grown. 

e HOW TO REPORT CROPS HARVESTED · AN EXAMPLE 

A farmer planted 100 acres of field corn. He irrigated 20 acres and cut them for 
silage; he estimated the production at 200 tons. Using a corn head on his combine, 
he harvested 80 acres, getting 7,000 bushels of shelled corn. He turned his cattle into 
the 100 acres after the harvest and let them graze. All 100 acres were fertilized, 
using 7 8/10 tons of dry fertilizer. 

His entries on the Census report are shown in the following illustration. 

Set1te. I- lu UJ FIELD COR• lllf"ttld for 1111 p~rtJOU hiHI Uirs plact rn UiP 

~Yu- C-p/1r. lfl11 Jectron 

CNo­t:. 9 I I. F1rld rocn for parn - Rtporl QMII&/U~ Aa.rr .:,It'd 
1J O'llt •••I o•lr- cUll!'• blr>il<'ll ur hJll!r,·duuv~t 
o/llidlrdcor• I...., 0""' I.,.., H...-d ... ~·9">1.,..~ 

2. F1eld ~orn for srla&r 

3 Frdd com c<>l IOf arccn 0< dty fodder, houed or 
v-zcd rDo aol rucllrdt lrrt 11Cf<'5 llfrt:11dr rttpur/rd 

•• rtn 1 or 2 r '-------

.C.CoiiUIIrrcoalfo:r.,lrzrr IIJCdonfrddcotn 

L•'tw.d Of fOO 

.T • .,<h. 

-1o 

a. Item 1 calls for grain or seed, so he entered 80 in the "Acres harvested" column 
and 7,000 in the bushels space in the "Quantity harvested" column. The 80 
acres for grain were not irrigated so he made no entry in the "Acres irrigated" 
column. 

b. For item 2, Corn for silage, he entered 20 acres harvested, 200 tons quantity 
harvested, and 20 acres irrigated. 

c. Since letting the cattle graze was a secondary use of land already harvested, he did 
not make any entry in item 3. 

d. In item 4, he entered 100 for "Acres fertilized," entered 7 for whole tons, and 8 
for tenths in the "Dry" space. 

-9-



OJ 
1\J ...... 

CROPS, 
GENERAL 
Continued 

Leaflet Guide-Continued 

• COMMERCIAL FERTILIZER 

For each crop, report the number of acres fertilized in 1969, and report the total 
tons and tenths of tons used in all applications. Report the total weight of the 
fertilizer, including filler. Report anhydrous ammonia in the "Liquid or gas" 
column. 

If you bought fertilizer on an analysis basis and do not know the total tons used, the 
following example will show you how to estimate the total tons of fertilizer. 

Example 1: A farmer fertilized 70 acres of corn at the rate of 100 pounds of N 
(nitrogen) per acre and used an analysis of 33·0·0, as recommended by the 
fertilizer dealer. 

To find the total tons of fertilizer used including filler: 

1. Divide the 100 pounds of nitrogen by the percent of nitrogen in the analysis, 
in this case 33, to get the total pounds of fertilizer per acre. 

2. Multiply the pounds per acre (obtained in step 1) by 70 acres to get total 
pounds of fertilizer used. 

3. Convert pounds to tons by dividing by 2,000. 

(1) 100 (pounds of N) = 10.000 = 303 (lbs. per acre) 
.33 (% of N in analysis) 33 

(2) 303 x 70 (acres)= 21,210 pounds. 
(3) 21,210 f 2,000 = 10 6/10 tons. 

If you don't know the percent analysis of nitrogen, but do know the phosphorus 
(P205l or potash !K20l, work the estimate in the same way as when nitrogen is the 
known factor. 

If you know how much fertilizer was applied per acre, but don't know the total 
tons, use the method in this example. 

Example 2: Sixty-five acres of corn were fertilized with 150 pounds of 
fertilizer per acre. 

To find the total tons of fertilizer used, multiply the 65 acres fertilized times the 
150 pounds of fertilizer used per acre. This gives the total pounds of fertilizer used. 
Then divide by 2,000 to get the total tons. 

a. Multiply 65 acres fertilized by 150 pounds of fertilizer per acre to get 9,750. 
b. Divide 9,750 total pounds of fertilizer by 2,000 to get 4.875. 
c. Enter 4 9/1 0 tons. 

• TWO OR MORE CROPS HARVESTED FROM THE SAME LAND 

Example 1. A farmer had a 20-acre field: 
a. He harvested oats from the 20 acres in 1969. 
b. He then planted the 20 acres in soybeans and harvested them during the 

same year. 

He should report: 
1. The 20 acres of oats in section 10, item 4. 
2. The 20 acres of soybeans in section 11, item 1. 
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CROPS, In such a case the acres of crops harvested may be greater than the acres of land 
GENERAL- reported in item 1 a of section 3 (land use). 
Continued 

SECTION 
14 

Example 2: A 10-acre field of red clover was cut for hay in 1969. 

The same 10 acres was later harvested for seed. 
1. Ten acres for hay should be reported in section 14, item 2. 
2. Ten acres for seed should be reported in section 15, item 1. 

e INTERPLANTED CROPS AND "SKIP-ROW" PLANTING 

If you grew two crops in alternate strips in the same field at the same time, report 
for each crop the part of the field used for that crop. 

Example 1: If a 40-acre tract of land was planted in cotton and soybeans, with two 
rows of cotton followed by an area of the same width planted in soybeans for beans, 
20 acres should be reported for beans in section 11, item 1, and 20 acres should be 
reported for cotton in section 12, item 1. 

Example 2: If you planted "skip" rows in soil-improvement crops, report the 
harvested portion of the field in the proper crop item and in section 3, item 1 a, and 
the soil-improvement acreage in section 3, item 1c. 

Example 3: If you left "skip" rows idle, report the harvested portion of the acres in 
the proper crop item and in section 3, item 1 a, and the idle acres in section 3, item 
1f. 

e CROPS HARVESTED IN ORCHARDS 

If approximately 4 acres of tomatoes were grown among the trees in a 10-acre apple 
orchard, you'd still report all10 acres as orchard acres in section 16, item 1, and also 
as apple acreage in section 17, item 1. Report the 4 acres of tomatoes in section 21, 
item 1. 

e REPORTING UNIT FOR QUANTITY HARVESTED 

The units of measure given on the report form for quantity of each crop harvested 
are, in general, those most commonly used throughout the country. For corn, grain 
sorghums, rice, grapes, prunes, and figs, a choice of two or more units is provided. 

If you happen to use in your records a unit different from what is printed on the 
form, please convert your figure on quantity harvested, to the unit shown. For your 
convenience, we have printed table 1 at the end of this leaflet, showing approximate 
weight- per unit for the crops most frequently reported. Use these if you do not have 
more accurate information available. 

Now you will want to start filling out the crops sections of the report form, referring 
to this leaflet, if necessary. 

HAY AND SILAGE HARVESTED FROM THE SAME LAND 

If you made one cutting of alfalfa for hay and another cutting for green feed, report 
the acres for the alfalfa cut for hay in item 1 of section 14, and report the acres 
again for hay crops cut and fed green in item 9 of the same section. 
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FIELD SEEDS 

The acres of. land harvested for field seeds often will have been reported in section 
14 because hay also was cut from the same land. If you fertilized the fields for the 
general purpose of getting better production of both hay and seed, report the "acres 
fertilized" and the quantity of fertilizer used only in section 14, item 10. But if you 
applied fertilizer especially for the benefit of the seed crop, report in item 9 of 
section 15 the "acres fertilized" and the weight (in tons) of fertilizer applied for the 
seed crop. 

ORCHARDS· FRUIT TREES, NUT TREES, AND GRAPEVINES 

In counting the combined total of trees and vines, include those for home use as well 
as those maintained for sale of the production. 

Include land in trees that, because of weather damage, did not bear in 1969. Also 
include orchard and grove acreage from which the crop was not harvested because of 
unsatisfactory prices, labor shortage, etc. Do not include acres in trees or vines that 
have been abandoned. 

If fruit and nut trees were planted in borders or were interplanted among other 
crops, estimate the orchard acreage by dividing the total number of such trees by the 
usual number of such trees per acre in your locality. 

When you need to estimate the acres in fruit and nut trees, first find the planting 
distance between trees, then divide the total number of trees by the number per acre 
that corresponds with the planting distance, as given in the following table. The 
result represents the approximate acreage. For example, 700 trees planted 25 feet x 
25 feet apart, ( 70 trees per acre) would represent 10 acres. 

Number of fruit and nut trees per acre 

Planting distance (feet) 

8 X 8 ........... . 
8 X 10 ........... . 
B X 12 ........... . 
9x 9 .......... .. 

10 X 10 ........... . 
10 X 12 ........... . 
12 X 12 ........... . 
12 X 14 ........... . 
14 X 14 ........... . 
15 X 15 ........... . 
16 X 16 ........... . 
18 X 18 ........... . 
1B X 20 ........... . 
18 X 22 ........... . 
20 X 20 ........... . 
20x22 ........... . 
20 X 24 ........... . 
22 X 22 ........... . 

Number 
per acre 

680 
545 
454 
538 
436 
363 
302 
259 
222 
194 
170 
134 
121 
110 
109 

99 
91 
90 

12 -

Planting distance (feet) 

22 X 24 ........... . 
24 X 24 ........... . 
25 X 25 ........... . 
26 X 26 ........... . 
27 X 27 ........... . 
28 X 28 ........... . 
28 X 30 ........... . 
30x30 ........... . 
32 X 32 ........... . 
35 X 35 ........... . 
36 X 36 ........... . 
40x40 ........... . 
40 X 45 ........... . 
45 X 45 ........... . 
45 X 50 ........... . 
50 X 50 ........... . 
55x50 .......... .. 
60x60 .......... .. 

Number 
per acre 

82 
75 
70 
64 
60 
56 
52 
48 
43 
35 
34 
27 
24 
22 
19 
17 
16 
12 

SECTION 
17 

Item 8 

Items 
10and11 

Item 15 

SECTION 
19 

Item 4 

Item 6 

Item 7 

SECTION 
21 

NONCITRUS FRUIT TREES OR GRAPEVINES 

Avocados · In California, report the quantity harvested between October 1, 1968, 
and September 30, 1969. In Florida, report the quantity harvested or to be 
harvested between July 1, 1969, and February 28, 1970. 

Grapes· Report raisin grapes on either a fresh·weight or dry·weight basis, according 
to how you sold them. If you sold raisin grapes by both methods, please convert to 
one basis. One pound of raisins usually equals about 4 3/10 pounds of fresh grapes. 
Report all other grapes on a fresh-weight basis. 

Please separate the European·type grapes among items 11a, 11b, and 11c of section 
17 on the basis of variety and not on the basis of use. Some of the common varieties 
are as follows: 

11a. Raisin varieties · Black Corinth, Muscat, Sultana, and Thompson Seedless. 
11b. Table varieties· Emperor, Malaga, Red Malaga, Ribier, and Tokay. 
11c. Wine varieties· Alicante Bouschet, Carignane, Grenache, Mission, 

Palomino, Petite Sirah, and Zinfandel. 

Olives· In California and Arizona, report the quantity harvested or to be harvested 
from the bloom of 1969 for the 1969·70 harvest season· September 15, 1969, to 
about February 28, 1970. In all other States report the total 1969 crop. 

NUT TREES 

Pecans · Improved pecans refer to pecan trees that have been budded, grafted or top 
worked. Consider all other pecan trees as wild or seedling, whether grown in 
orchards, pastures, etc. 

For quantity of tung nuts harvested, report pounds in the husk. For all other tree 
nuts, report quantity in the shell. ' 

Report planted black walnuts in item 7. Do not report wild black walnuts. 

VEGETABLES, SWEET CORN, OR MELONS 

Report vegetable crops harvested in the calendar year 1969 for all States except 
Florida. For Florida, report any vegetable crops that were harvested between 
October 1, 1968, and September 30, 1969. 

Report the entire acreage of each vegetable crop harvested. For example, if you 
harvested three acres of radishes from a field in 1969, then replanted the field to 
radishes and harvested the three acres again, report 6 acres harvested in section 21, 
item 15, No. 350. (If crops are grown, such as radishes, which are included in the 
"Other vegetable crops" list, below item 15 in section 21, write the name of the 
crop and the code number (Radishes .... 350) in the spaces provided in item 15.) If 
each crop of radishes was fertilized, report only 3 acres fertilized but report the total 
tons of all fertilizer used. 

-13'-



CD 
N 
w 

SECTION 
22 

Item 6 

SECTION 
23 

SECTION 
24 

SECTIONS 
25-29, 

GENERAL 

SECTION 
25 

Leaflet Guide-Continued 

NURSERY OR GREENHOUSE PRODUCTS GROWN FOR SALE 

Mushrooms - Report the square feet of bed space used in 1969, multiplied by the 
number of times it was harvested. Do not report the total floor space of the building 
or other area where the mushrooms were grown. For example, if you harvested two 
crops of mushrooms from an area of 20,000 square feet of bed space, report 40,000 
square feet of area used. 

OTHER CROPS 

In addition to the crops named in this section, also use section 23 to report any 
crops harvested that have not been accounted for in sections 8-22. 

Sugarcane - The sugarcane growing season differs in each of the three growing areas 
in the United States. Report acres harvested (or to be harvested) during the current 
cutting season, as follows: 

In Florida, November 1969 through April 1970. 
In Louisiana, October 1969 through December 1969. 
In Hawaii, October 1, 1968, through September 30, 1969. 

In Florida and Louisiana, report acres of sugarcane planted for harvest later than the 
current cutting season, as cropland idle, in section 3, item lf. For Hawaii, special 
provision is made on the form for reporting sugarcane planted for future harvest. 

FOREST PRODUCTS SOLD 

Report here, all forest products sold from this place in 1969, regardless of who made 
the sales. For example, sales made by the landlord should be included. 

POULTRY, CATTLE, HOGS, SHEEP, OTHER LIVESTOCK 

These items deal with the livestock and poultry on this place or sold from this place 
in 1969, regardless of ownership. If livestock or poultry were fed on this place on a 
contract or on a custom basis, report them as sold if they were taken from this place 
in 1969. Animals or poultry owned by you that were not on this place at any time 
in 1969 because they were fed for you by someone else, such as in a feedlot or 
poultryhouse, are not to be included in this report; they should be accounted for on 
the agriculture census report for the feedlot, poultryhouse, etc. 

Count as being on this place, animals that were owned by you or kept by you for 
others, but which on December 31, 1969, were on land used on a permit basis 
(national forestland; grazing district land; or rangeland administered by the Bureau 
of Land Management). See "Grazing permit," page 6 of this leaflet. 

Do not include in your report any livestock or poultry on land that in 1969 was 
rented or leased to others. Your report should cover only the livestock and poultry 
on the "Acres in This Place" as reported in item 4 of section 1. 

CHICKENS, TURKEYS, OTHER POULTRY 

For each item, report the number on this place December 31, 1969, no matter who 
owned them, and the number of poultry sold from this place, or taken from this 
place during 1969, including those raised or fed under a contract. Do not include 
any sales of baby chicks or poults. 
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Item 3b 

SECTION 
26 
Item 2 

Item 4 

SECTION 
27 

Item 1a 

ltem3 

SECTION 
30 

Hens and pullets of laying age- Include hens in molt with the other hens and pullets 
of laying age. In the "sold" column include any old or cull hens sold during 1969. 

Other turkeys - In the "sold" column, report turkeys sold for slaughter and those 
that were brooded and then moved to another place for further feeding. 

CATTLE AND CALVES 

Milk cows- Include cows of any breed milked for home use or for sale. 

In the "Total number sold" answer spaces, include the cattle and calves sold for a 
landlord or given to a landlord or others in trade or in payment for goods and 
services. Include animals fed on this place under contract or on a custom basis if 
they were taken from this place in 1969. Do not include animals bought and resold 
within 30 days. Such transactions are considered to be "dealer" purchases and sales. 

In the "Number fattened ... "answer spaces, report the number of head that were 
sold for slaughter after being fattened in the manner described, provided they were 
expected to produce carcasses that would grade "USDA Good" or better. Do not 
report in this column veal calves which were fattened primarily on milk, or dairy 
cows fed only the usual dairy ration before being sold; do not include cattle or 
calves that have been fed grain or concentrates and sold for further feeding. 

Hogs and pigs used or to be used for breeding -Include bred sows and bred gilts, 
other sows and gilts intended for breeding, and boars and young males to be used for 
breeding. 

Hogs and pigs sold from this place in 1969 - Include all pigs born on this place that 
were sold for slaughter or taken from this place for further feeding. 

CONTRACT OR BINDING AGREEMENT 

Many farm products are produced under a contract or binding agreement made 
between the producer and the person who buys or uses the farm product. These 
contracts or agreements usually specify the kind and amount of the farm product to 
be produced, where or to whom it is to be delivered, what price the producer is to 
be paid or how the price is to be determined. The contracts may specify the variety 
of crop or breed of animal or pou I try to be produced, and may provide for services 
such as spraying, dusting, fertilizing, harvesting, packing, and selling. The contractor 
may supply seed, fertilizer, or feed. He may also provide financing and a field man 
to give advice and to inspect the product while it is being produced. Include 
contracts for the growing of heifers for dairy farms, contracts involving cow pools, 
milking pools, and cow-leasing agreements. 

In this section, include under the "Co-op" item, production contracts with a 
cooperative processor. Do not include contracts made by you to have someone else 
provide a service to you or grow or produce something for you. 

Report sales contracts or agreements providing just for the marketing or sale of a 
product, such as milk, as "Marketing or sales contracts or agreements." Also report 
under this same heading, marketing contracts and agreements with marketing 
associations and cooperatives. Usually very few or no services or supplies are 
provided by the buyer of the farm product under a sales contract or agreement. 
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If the sales contract or agreement provides also for supplying or furnishing feed, 
seed, labor or equipment, report it as a production contract. 

Do not report contracts or agreements which do not provide specifically for the 
production or marketing of agricultural products. Some examples of agreements or 
contracts not to be reported here are: 

A ental of land 

Purchase of feed, fertilizer 
or other farm supplies 

Government program agreements 

Customwork 

MACHINERY AND EQUIPMENT 

Hauling 

Labor wage agreements and 
financing of farm operations 

Agricultural services 

Farm machinery rentals 

The items in this section refer to machinery and equipment kept on this place and 
used for the farm business in 1968 or 1969, regardless of ownership. 

Item 12 refers to the market value of all machinery and equipment, not just the 
items listed on the report form. The value you report should be your estimate of 
how much the machinery and equipment would sell for in its present condition ·not 
the replacement cost or the depreciated value. 

HIRED WORKERS 

Do not include worke•s who did only contruction work or other work not related to 
the production of crops or livestock. Do not include employees of a labor 
contractor, cooperative, processor, or dealer who performed contract work on this 
place. Report all other hired workers, including members of your family if they were 
paid wages, who did farm or ranch work on this place. Report each person only once 
even though he may have worked several different times during thP year. 

INSECTICIDES, HERBICIDES, FUNGICIDES, OTHER PESTICIDES, LIME 
AND OTHER CHEMICALS 

For each item report only once the total acres treated, but give the total cost of 
materials used in all treatments. If you used a dual purpose chemical, report the 
total acres treated for each item (insect, disease, etc.), and divide the cost of 
materials between the items. If the same acreage was treated separately for two 
purposes, give acres and cost of materials for each item. For exsmple, if cotton was 
treated for insects and then treated for defoliation, the acres and material cost for 
insect treatment would be reported under item 2b and the acres and material cost 
for defoliation would be reported in item 3. 

Do not include the cost of chemically treated seed or the cost of chemicals used by 
you to treat seed prior to planting. 
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Item 10 

PRODUCTION EXPENSES 

Include expenses paid by you and by anyone else for the production of crops, 
poultry, livestock, and other agricultural products on this place. Please give estimates 
if you do not know the exact figures. For exsmple, if you grew broilers or fed cattle 
for others, include in the production expenses, item 1, your best estimate of the 
value of the baby chicks or cattle at the time they were brought to this place. Also 
include, in item 2, the value and amount of all feed purchased by you or someone 
else for use on this place. 

Do not include expenses (or sales) related to nonfarm activities (trading and 
speculation, or livestock dealer activities). 

Livestock and poultry · Report the total amount spent by you and by your landlord 
or by others for all livestock and poultry bought during 1969 for production, 
including feeding, on this place. For livestock or poultry grown under contract or 
fed on a custom basis on this place, include your estimate of their value at the time 
they came on this place. 

Do not include the purchase cost of livestock or poultry bought and then resold 
within 30 days. 

Feed · Report the cost of all feed for livestock and poultry during 1969. When feed 
was supplied by others, as in broiler contracts, estimate the cost of the feed used on 
this place. Do not include the cost of feed for livestock fed off this place, but do 
include the cost of feed fed to cattle or sheep while they are on "permit" grazing 
land (see "Grazing permit," on page 6 of this leaflet). 

Commercially mixed formula feeds · Include all complete feeds, concentrates, feed 
additive supplements, base mixes and premixes fed in 1969. Include your best 
estimate of tons and value of feed furnished by others for livestock and poultry that 
were grown or fed on this place for others under contract. 

All other prod~:ction expenses 

Include-
Purchase of irrigation water 
Costs of operating and maintaining irrigation systems 
Farm electricity 
Veterinary services and medicine 
Hauling and other marketing charges 
Farm supplies 
Farm taxes 
Interest on farm debts 
All other farm-related expenditures 

Do not include-
Value of the landlord's share of crops or livestock produced on this place 
Purchase of long-term assets, such as tractors and machinery, land, or new 
buildings 

Expenditures for construction of major improvements, such as drainage canals, 
irrigation systems, etc. 

Income taxe~ 
Interest on nonfarm loans 
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MARKET VALUE OF AGRICULTURAL PRODUCTS SOLD 

These questions are asked to obtain a measure of the agricultural productivity of 
your county, State, and the entire United States. Information given in this report 
will be combined with that for other farms in your county and only totals will be 
published. By Federal law, the information you give in this report is confidential. 
Your report is to be used for statistical purposes only, and cannot be revealed to 
anyone who is not a Census employee. Census employees are under oath (with 
penalty for violation) not to reveal such information. 

Report the total gross value of all crops sold from this place in 1969, regardless of 
the year they were produced; and the value of all poultry, livestock, and their 
products sold from this place any time in 1969. Do not report your net income. Do 
not report value of sales from land which you rented to others. If you rent land 
from others or work land on shares for others, include the value of the landlord's 
share of any products removed from this place. If you operate as a partnership, 
include the total value of all products sold from this place for all partners. Include 
the value of crops you have placed under government loan or seal in 1969 along with 
the value of all crops sold. 

Sales from nonfarm-related activities (such as trading and speculation, or livestock 
dealer activities) should not be included. 

Value of products harvested by others · If crops were harvested by cooperatives or 
by others, and you received for your product a price which did not include the cost 
of harvesting, hauling, etc., please report the gross value which includes these costs 
before they were deducted. If your records do not show such figures separately, 
please estimate the cost of such services and include these with the value of the 
product. Also be sure that the cost of these services has been included in the proper 
production expense items in section 34. 

Livestock or crops under contract · For livestock or crops, including vegetables and 
fruits, produced by you under contract, report the gross value before deductions for 
any feed, seeds, plants, fertilizer, sprays, dusts, and labor or equipment furnished by 
the contractor. For example, if you received $1,000 cash and you estimate that the 
contractor furnished $500 in seeds, production and harvesting costs, report $1,500 
as the gross sales value of the crops grown under contract. The value of materials 
furnished or paid for by others also should be included in the proper items in section 
34. 

Poultry and poultry products • Report the value of all eggs, broilers, hens and 
roosters, started pullets, ducks, turkeys, and other poultry and their eggs sold or 
moved from this place during 1969. If the sale price is not known, please give your 
best estimate of their market value when they left this place. For example, if you 
produced 10,000 pounds of poultry on a contract basis and you estimate the market 
price at 20 cents per pound, then you should report $2,000 as the market value. 

Dairy products · Include the gross value of all milk and cream sold from this place. 
Report the total value before hauling costs and Co-op dues are subtracted. 

Dairy cattle and calves . Report the total value of sales of all dairy cattle and calves 
(including heifers, bulls, and bull calves) sold from this place. 
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Other cattle and calves · Report the value of sales of all cattle and calves other than 
dairy animals sold from this place in 1969. Be sure to include the total value of sales 
without deducting cost of feed, cost of livestock purchased, or cost of hauling and 
selling, etc. If the sales price is not known, please give your best estimate of their 
market value when they left this place. The value of sales of cattle and calves bought 
and kept on this place less than 30 days before removal should not be included. 

Do not report the value of sales of livestock owned by you but held on and sold, 
from someone else's place. For example. do not report cattle purchased elsewhere, 
fed in, and sold from a feedlot not part of this place. For cattle moved from your 
place to a feedlot for further feeding, give your best estimate of their market value 
when they left this place. 

Hogs, sheep, and goats · Include the value of all hogs and pigs, sheep, lambs, wool, 
goats, and mohair sold or taken from this place during 1969. Report the value (or 
give your best estimate) of animals of all ages without regard to ownership or who 
shared the receipts. Include animals fed under contract or on a custom basis on this 
place if the animals were sold or taken from this place during 1969. 

FARM RELATED INCOME RECEIVED IN 1969 

Report all government payments received by you from any of the following 
direct-payment programs: 

• Feed grain diversion and price support 
• Wheat diversion and marketing certificate 
• Upland cotton diversion and price support 
• Agricultural conservation 
• Emergency conservation 
• Cropland adjustment 
• Conservation reserve (soil bank) 
• Appalachian Land Stabilization and Conservation 
• Sugar 
• Wool and mohair 

This total amount may have been furnished to you recently in a "Report of 
Payment to Producer" (notice sent to you by the Agricultural Stablization and 
Conservation Service). If so, you may copy this figure on your Census report. 
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Table 1 - Approximate Net Weight Per Unit 

~ec-~ltem 
t1on No. 
No. 

Crop Unit 

8 

9 

10 
10 
10 
10 
10 
10 
10 
10 
10 
10 

11 
11 

11 
11 
11 
11 
11 
11 

12 

12 

12 
13 

13 

Field corn for grain: 
Shelled ...................... I Bushel ..... . 

(70 lb. ear corn, husked = 1 bu. 
shelled corn) 

Sorghums for grain or seed .......... I Bushel ..... . 
(1-ton heads= 25 bu. grain) 

1-3 Wheat . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 
4 Oats . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 
5 Barley . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 
6 Rye . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 
8 Flaxseed . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 
9 Buckwheat . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 

10 Proso millet . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 
11 Emmer and spelt . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 
13 Safflower . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 
14 Mustard seed . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 

1 I Soybeans for beans .............. . 
2 Peanuts for nuts: 

Virginia type ................. . 
Runners, S.E ................. . 
Spanish .................... . 

3 Dry field and seed beans .......... . 
4 Dry lima beans ................ . 
5 Dry field and seed peas ...... · ..... . 
6 Cowpeas for dry peas ............ . 
7 Velvetbeans for beans (hulled) ...... . 
8 Mungbeans for beans ............ . 

Cotton: 
Gross (seed cotton) ............. . 
Net (lint cotton) .............. . 

(1,500 lb. seed cotton= 1 bale) 
41 Popcorn: 

Ear, husked .................. . 
Shelled ..................... . 

(70 lb. ear com, husked= 1 bu. 
shelled com) 

51 Broomcorn . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 
1 Irish potatoes ................. . 

( 1 bag = 1 hundredweight = 1 00 lb.) 

2 I Sweetpotatoes ................. . 
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Bushel 

Bushel 
Bushel 
Bushel 
Bushel 
Bushel 
Bushel 
Bushel 
Bushel 
Bushel 

Bale 
Bale 

Bushel 
Bushel 

Bale ...•... 
Bushel ..... . 
Barrel ..... . 
Bag ....... . 
Bushel ..... . 
Crate ...... . 

Pounds 

56 

56 

60 
32 
48 
56 
56 
48 
50 
40 
40 
60 

60 

17 
21 
25 
60 
56 
60 
60 
60 
60 

500 
480 

70 
56 

333 
60 

165 
100 
55 
50 

Table 1 ·Approximate Net Weight Per Unit-Continued 

Sec-~ Item 
tion No. 
No. 

Crop Unit 

14 

15 
15 
15 
15 
15 
15 
15 

17 

17 

17 

17 

17 
17 

17 

17 

17 

17 

17 

17 
17 

17 

1-71 Hay 
(3 tons green= 1 ton dry) 

1 Red clover seed . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 
2 Alfalfa seed . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 
3 Lespedeza seed . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 
4 Timothy seed . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 
5 Bromegrass seed . .. . .. .. .. .. .. .. . Bushel 
6 Orchardgrass seed . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 
7 Sweetclover seed . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel 

Apples ...................... -I Bushel 
Northwest box 
Fibreboard box, 
cell pack ... . 

2-3 I Peaches ...................... \ Bushel ..... . 
Lug box .... . 
California 

fruit box ... 
4-51 Pears: 

California . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel ..... . 
Other . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Bushel ..... . 
Western . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Box ....... . 

6-7~ Cherries ...................... ~~~~beil·l~g: : 

B Avocados . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Lug ....... . 
10 Grapes, American type ............ 4-quart climax 

11a Grapes, European type-raisin varieties 
(1 lb. dried= 4 3/10 lb. fresh) 

basket ..... 
12-quart basket 

11 b Grapes, European type-table varieties Lug ....... . 
4-basket crate 

12-13 Plums and prunes: 
California . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 4-basket crate 
Other . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . %-bushel basket 

13\ Prunes 
(California: 1 lb. dried= 2 7/10 lb. 

fresh) 
(Other: 1 lb. dried= 3 to 4 lb. fresh) 

14 I Apricots ...................... \ Lug 
(Brentwood) 

4-basket crate 
151 Olives ...................... ·I Lug ....... . 
16 Figs, fresh . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . Box, single-

161 Figs 
(California: 1 lb. dried= 3 lb. fresh) 
(Other: 1 lb. dried= 4 lb. fresh) 
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layer ..... . 

Pounds 

60 
60 
30 
45 
14 
14 
60 

45 
44 

40 
48 
20 

18 

48 
50 
46 
20 
16 
13 

6 
20 

28 
20 

30 
28 

24 
26 
28 

6 
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Table 1 ·Approximate Net Weight Per Unit-Continued Index 

~-~Item 
~0:, No. I Crop 

1B I 1 I Valencia oranges: 
California and Arizona ........... 
Florida and Texas ............... 

1BI 
21 Navel oranges . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 

1B 3 Temple oranges . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 
1B 4 Other oranges: 

California and Arizona ........... 
Florida, Texas, and Louisiana ....... 

1B I 51 Tangerines and mandarins: 
California and Arizona ........... 
Florida ...................... 
Texas ....•.................. 

1B I 
1B 

61 Tangelos . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 
7 Grapefruit: 

California, desert valleys .......... 
Other California ................ 
Florida and Texas ............... 

1B I Bl Lemons: 
California and Arizona ........... 
Florida and Texas ............... 

1B 9 Limes ....................... 
19 1 Walnuts ...................... 

20 1 Strawberries ............•...... 
20 2-3 Raspberries .................... 
20 4 Cranberries .................... 
20 5 Other berries . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 
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I Unit I Pounds 

Field box .... 55 
Field box .... 90 
Field box .... 52 
Field box .... 90 

Field box .... 52 
Field box .... 90 

Field box .... 75 
Field box .... 90 
Field box .... 100 
Field box .... 90 

Field box .... 50 
Field box .... 52 
Field box .... BO 

Field box .... 52 
Field box .... 90 
Bushel ...... 55 

Bushel ...... 50 

Quart ...... 1~ 
Quart ...... 1~ 
%-barrel box .. 25 
Quart ...... 1~ 

Page 

Acres in this place . . • . . . . . . • . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 4, 5 
Artificial drainage • . . . • . . • . . . . . . . • . . . . . . . . . 8 
Avocados .............................. 13, 21 

Black walnuts ......••................... 13, 22 

Cattle and calves •.••............. 14, 15, 17, 18. 19 
cattle and calves fattened for slaughter . . . . . . . . . . 15 
Cents not required . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3 
Changes in operation of land . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 4 
Chemicals . . . . . . . . . • . . . . . • . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 16 
Chickens ..........••.....•............. 14. 17 
Citrus fruit and trees . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. 12, 22 
Commercial feeds . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 17 
Commercial fertilizer .....•................. 10, 13 
Contracts or agreements . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 15-18 
Cropland harvested .. . .. .. .. .. .. . .. .. .. .. .. 7 
Crop failure . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 7 
Crops harvested . . . . . . . . . . . . . • • • . . . . • • . . . . 8-14 
Crops in orchards ............ , . . . . . . . . . . . . 11 
Crops, miscellaneous ............. , . . . . . . . . . 14 
Crops not listed on the report form . , . . . . . . . . . . 14 
Crops or livestock under contract ............... 15-18 
Cultivated summer fallow .................. , 7 

Dairy cattle end calves . • • • . . • • • . . • • • . . • • • • • 18 
Dairy products . . . . . • . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 18 
Drainage, artificial . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 8 

Equipment end machinery . • . . . . . . . • • . . . . . . . . 16 
Expanses paid by others . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 17 
Expenses, production . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 17 
Extra report forms . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3 

Fallow land ...... : ..................... . 
Feed. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 17 
Fiald seeds .....•..........•...•........ 12, 21 
Fertilizer ...........•................... 10, 13 
Forest products . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 14 
Fruit end trees ......•.........•..... 12. 13. 21,22 
Fungicides . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 16 

General information . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3 
Goats . . . . • . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . • . • . . . . . . . . • . 19 
Government farm programs . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 19 
Grapes ....................•........... 13, 21 
Grazing permit land . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 6 

Hay and silage from same land ....... , . . . . . . . . 11 
Hens ............................. 14. 15, 17, 18 
Herbicides . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 16 
Hired workers . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 16 
Hogs end pigs ...................... 14, 15, 17, 19 
How to mark your answers . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3 
How to use this leaflet . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 4 

Income, farm related . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 19 
Insecticides . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 16 
I nterplanted crops . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 11 
Irrigation . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 7. 8 

Lend not operated on December 31, 1969 ....... . 
Land owned ........................... . 
Land rented or leased from others ............ . 
Land rented or leased to others .............. . 
Land worked on shares .••..•••.•.••••.....• 
Land use .............................. . 

Page 

4 
5 
5 
5 
5 

Lend value . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 4 
Lime . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . • . . 16 
Livestock-cattle, hogs. sheep, other livestock .. 14. 15, 17, 18 
Livestock or crops under contract .............. 15-18 
Location of agricultural activity . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 6 

Machinery and equipment . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 16 
Market value of agricultural products sold . . . . . . . . 18 
Melons . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . • . . . . . . . . 13 
Milk cows .....................•..... 14, 15, 18 
Miscellaneous crops . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 14 
Mushrooms . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 14 

Noncitrus fruit and fruit trees ............. 12, 13, 21 
Nonfarm activities ................... 4, 16, 17,18 
Nunery products . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 14 
Nuts and trees ........................ 12. 13, 22 

Olives ................................. 13, 21 
Orchards .......................... 12. 13, 21. 22 
Other crops . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 14 
Ownenhip oflend . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . • . . . . . . . . . 4. 5 

Pastureland ............................ . 
Paeans . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . • . • . . . . . . . 13 
Pesticides . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 16 
Pigs . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . ........ 14, 15, 17, 19 
Poultry ............................. 14, 17, 18 
Production expenses . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 17 
Pullets ............................. 15, 17. 18 

Reporting unit for quantity harvested . . . . . . . . . . . 11 

Sheep . . . . . . • . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . ... 14, 17, 19 
Skip-row planting . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 11 
Sugarcane . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 14 
Summer fallow . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 7 
Sweet corn . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 13 
Swine ............................ 14, 15. 17, 19 

"This Place'" • . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 6 
Township, district, etc . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 6 
Trees and forest products . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 14 
Turl<eys ............................ 14, 15, 17 
Two or more crops from same land. . . . . . . . . . . . 10 

Value of land and buildings . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 4 
Value of machinery and equipment . . . . . . . . . . . . . 16 
Value of products harvested by others . . . . . . . . . . 18 
Veli..a of products sold . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 18 
Vagatables .............................. 13, 17 

Water used in irrigation . . . 7, 8 
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